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IMPROVEMENT
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TOTAL DOMESTIC RECEIPTS. OF FARK
New Yerk, September 10, 1907 ' Executor = Trme at his offic e d by the City
3 R 257 | Dressed poultry, pkgs. 1,824 Ghlmred 18220 . - mm’ Bullding. corner of Main -
e P10 888 Tive pouttry, crmtes. . 162 2 . - Beptember 17, 1007, for $15.000 00 Pack Improversent
d b BRI ranges (Cal), cases.. 3.050 € f Indebtedness of g
. 5“_’1: 'i:"[\os {Cal), crates.. E.T.ﬂ | Th F ) L d Tlru t Co 4 p to C g .‘:’““lm“ .n- -
D B Eame b ot 2l THE NEW YORK CURB 1ac at at rimes ctnee § | 6 rarmers Loanl al St Lompany, £ B i T e A
80,600 Prunes (Cal), pkgs s at 3 mes since its inception some thirty years i L LT ber B e
..126.000 Apples. bbis . 3g0 been an open market for the securities of some of the most importantecurﬁp;u:s of NOS- ].6, 18, 20 & 22 Wllllﬂ.m Smt. ?S::'? ":;gc:;“ ’"—l":’““m per -—“. m will bs
= | 0 person. firm or corporation
high ™ ’,

_ 80,000, Pctatoes, bbls the world, 1 s
5 Branch Oﬁce’ 475 Plﬁh Avenue’ . day of September, 1907 mdm-h:'uu-.:!:..‘-%,a

1,120 Onions, pkgs .
It is true that occasionally com
s ally panies of doubtful standing have taken advanta : :
. ' ; . dak ol ay of May, 1912, Interest on the said certificates
in::rmal organization to attempt to sell petty promotion stocks of the most undesirable NeW YOl‘k- ;;"'”:‘;.’;"':'5"" ek o
sort; however, the growing importance of the Curb Market, the great publicity R!\'C‘ﬂ‘ to -

Each proposal must be d by a certified
88l Sia transactiine = S ) ! g LONDORN: b Pms_! check on a National Bank or an incorporated bank
odicin « . @nd the desire of newspapers and of regular quotation sheets to 18 Bishopsgate St., Withia, 78 Rue de Richelisn Trus: Company of the Stata of New York. for §1.000.00,
_ nate from publication the quotations of stocks which notoriously 3> not have 2 rable to the order of the City Treasurer of the

pay City
. . ~

. . ; . : : ‘ of New Rochelle, such d
e gy o hyeral s el gt .ot b Letters of Credit, Bills of Exchange, Cable Transfers Tity IF the parts’ oc parties. tn whom thes ceretioetes
o R g | shall be awarded -h'-ll fail to» take and pay for the

“'T"r:-l" am;;rdanco with the terms of sale
; certificates to be delivered at the office

City Treasurer of the City of New Rochelle, N. ." —
the 25th Jay of September. 1007 5

( - s . e ne
Spirits turp, bbis.....
5! Tar, bbis . wooa
2.260! Dlen stock,

250 Peanuts, hags

77 Tobacco, hhds

180’ Tobacco, pkes

997 Whiskey. hbis

185| Wool, bales ...
3.810! Wool, sacks

125 Cotton. bales

385 | Quicksilver, flas

250, Copper, pleces

IMPORTANT—Buy ONLY stocks that have been publicly traded in on the Curb at

14855 Lead, PKRE --........ 1978 least a year, that can be sold as easily as . ] % wis a
6.416| Wine (Cal). bbis...... =00 SIS ecinea and Shxt & ; = they can be bought, that show rallying power No bids will be received for less than par.
543 i » z & arke n which bic¢ wrice and o c rchasers will be required to ¥
14 582 n at do not have a market in which bid g 1 offered price are Purch eq pay accrued intersst.
g | far apart.—— , The Common Council reserves the right to refect
EXPORTS. | l. any or all bids
The certificates wili he engraved under the super-
Metropo l‘ a n vision of and certified as to their genuineness bv the

§6.180 Naphtha, gals

! Tl'm .methnd of trading on the Curb is the same as on the New York Stock Exchange; pan Tuding
1.908! Benzine., gals ...... 0 commissions, however, are lower. - T o
the opinion of codnsel as to the vaMdiry.
. rus

i
. 20,000 !
. gals. 500 | The opportunities for making 1 Dated N ~
2 Tt < g large returns on the money invested are s ated New Rochelle, N. Y., August 29, 1907.
1 . gals 178,350 4 3 ed are many, as - b
10,500 . AR 6 | fluctuations in Curb Stocks are frequently 1007 to 3007 I e & c an CRARCAT A"
350 Beef, bhls S 203 . p y — - - e ————
£.750 Bacons, T ... m; ‘:;-:. { . Curb St.nvks are usually moderate priced and may be bought outright—in this way there om ‘on SALE.
32 409 . | is not the risk of loss through exhausted margins. PAYS 30/ ]NTEREST of the City of New Yerk g..,.dﬂ" :’T NEW ROCHELLE, N. Y.
] pet, gals. . 1.553.580 | They are not except in a few instances, th k £ th  y h ’ ‘9 w“" -t l!-l;l- ‘(-mf":olp;\ !ah: t“ll;A: ';;a;"ﬂ;::!;g nr:' :::ne‘rnoyl ‘;:'.
- oy i stances, the stocks of those “Trusts” which are being | - B i d Mechanie Streets, » 8 o’clock P Tuesday.
CASH QUOTATIONS. | subjected to Administration attacks. =i on Daily Balances, Subject to Capital, Surplus & Profits, $9,000,000 Sostember 17, 1007, for the purchase of & v 2l
e 350 1 Sy R3990 . | , | Check, Payable in N. Y. Funds. _BRAYTON IVES, Presideut. part of $50.000.00, Registered five per cent. Fire De-
Jrom, 2NOT. 2 T TR 00 - Established Curb Stocks have valuable properties hehind o { ANTON A. RAVEN, Vice.-Pres. partment Bonds. series of 1907, of sald City. of §1.000.00
Steel = 28 90 : perties behind them which are bound to come |} | REVERLY CHEW. 24 Vice-Pres. ach, dnted September 16 1007. and mnturing SRANIGN
1;::. c Eaar s [ to the front in time, and they are at present offering poscibilities which are greater, for | CAPITAL . «eoranennnn ... 807,000 f’iti[ggA!xC&g'G:EB,"E::'.nnr. on the first day of May, 1917, and $5.000.00 omn the firee
Exche Beef, family ! the money invested, than those offered by any other known securities in the world. ‘ SURPLUS AND PROFITS..$1.500,000 J:\tsq. F. McCNAMARA. Trust O : o 'Tf.hnr‘é';’xr?.:;"zi:“i ':";e.-:‘"t ‘lr:“mmd-
Jter Beef hame ...... | ; RUPERT W._ K. ANDERSON, Asat. Tr. o he first days of No
t Ne 2 . ) Tallow, prime ...... i ) ' FREDERICK E. FRIED, Asst. Sec. _’Prl;:mr;-;nnd interest payable at the office of the
©orn. N0 2 mixe 6% Pork. mess 1795 FAMUEL FREEMAN., PRESIDENT. DIRECTORS: 2 iy
s 53 | Hoge, dressed. 160 _ 8% | . ’ | James A. Webb, Vice-Pres. Wiiliam L. Bull. E. D. Morgan. .‘.;a;hn:':f). "’;Ln:‘v'it:a"zei a&::m:fnl:‘ by & un-f-l
< o . 5 he n i ¥ rust company
o ! Lard, prime .1 . L] : Willard W. Cutler, Vice-Pres. Carpender. l"‘é‘;‘“‘_ the State of New York for $2.300.00, pavable to the
19 Exchance Place. Boston 3% Broad St., New York i Jno. H. B. Corlell, Sec'y. CJHI. 'M'_"'“‘ ::’:“"Y’ of the City Treasurer of the City of New Ro-

Harry A. Van Gllder, Treas.
Kalph S. Streett, Asst. Sec'y and Treas

z
>
i

Bonds will be engraved under the supervision of and
cartified as to their genuineness by the United States
Mortgage and Trust Company, including the opinfon
of counsel as to the validity

No bid of jess than par value of the bonds will be
considered. Bidders must use the printed form of
proposal furnished by the undersigned Accrued In-
terest to be paid by the purchaser, and Jelivery will
be mada at the office of the City Treasurer in New
Rochelie on the 23th day of September, 1997

The right is reserved to reject any or all bida
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| List of Established Curb Stocks sent on request
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COFFEE—The coffee market opened eas:
of @26 points, owing to lower French cat
gering liquidation But there seemed to
sand =t the decline, offerings were gra
ssd the market had a gartial vecovery,

-, 8t a net decline of 3GI16 poin
&: were reported of about 28.00
pothing in the primsry mews, =0 far as
suggest =ny change in the =ftpation an
the French market 1=idered lar
gealizine after the recent advance At
g€ MHavre wes =:@% franc

&
b
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‘il INVESTORS READ e ' 1
L T.. wa" Sfl'ﬂﬂ J.urnal TO HOLDERS OF THE !
Ty — — | Preferred and GCommen Sfock ‘f FRANKLIN ) P e e e .
Voting Trust Cerfificates Trust CoMEENY. || o

;
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recovery later, and the
i Hambu

OF THE 140 Broadway, Manhattan | Y. Cit i >
: ian markets mat : | 164-166 Montague St., Brooklyn { *" " e Dividend Notices. Sellodcmo::lrs :El'bo-:exr:-!-\-!:;‘b'; - gxty Clare
Capital, § 1s of e C . corner of Maim
INTERN‘ATIONAL N‘ERCANTILE ! l::‘-l‘l'\ai:;e;“;'l:::“ﬂ:t:z‘:er 541500!000 GUGGENHEIM EXPLORATION COMPANY, ::\uh ;l»’:‘?;;!‘ltnsr')::p:s,,({;p“v‘:l ‘8:1‘!?’::: p m. Tuesday,
N \ GEORGE M. SOUTHARD. Fresldent. ’ 71 Broadway, New York, September 5th, 1807. September 17, 1907, for the purchase of all or any part
e Bty h‘ARINE COMPANV | DIVIDEND NO. 18 of $15.000.00, Registered filve per ceant. Assesament
i i The Directors of the Guggenheim Exploration Company | Map Bonds, serles of 1907, of said City. of $1.000 00

m———| rave this day declared a quarteclv dividend of TW? | aach dated September 18, 197 and maturing $5.000.00

AND ONE HALF (2'2) PER CENT on the full pald | o, the first day of May. 1917: $5.000.00 on the first

ital stock issiue of the Company, payable October lat, | a5 ¢ Ma 191S. and $5.000.00 on the first

stockholders of record at three o'clock In the | 4,y of May 19  Intersst payable semi-annually om
7

- 1
moon of September 13th, 1907 the first days of November and May: principal and tn-

Iling during the day
but large dis S —
and May
quotations on

— s i

of the Voting Trust Certifi-
5 wtatoes al
cates for the Preferred and Common Stock of this " o e

having

Holders of a maj

more plenty and declining Onions have
but demand light. C(abbages seiling fairiy
d pickies jower under dull trade Caull-

markat Was

d futures at £187
with qQuotations rar

of 6c : . e e el
ten ot 1 2 e local market to-day g = E gnifled thelr desire that the wing
e mt':"-\:: PRh—— ”A.n.zrn:';\"n”:w!-'w d » extended for a p 4 demand and steady Corn meeting a The bocks for the transfer of the stock of the COMPany | s.rege payable at the office of the City Tregsurer.

s el arket was weak ts n the circular issued to the Voting Trust Certid- ; & L Egeplats dull and weak. Lettuce con- | wili close at three o'clcck in the afterncon of September ( ",y proposal must be accompanied by a certified
> oo ) el i e ' . < #° | tinues and prices low Lima beans closing lower. | 13th and reopen October Znd. 1907, g | cheok on an incorporated hank or trust company in the
- ng date New York., June 3, < s scarce. Peppers ak Peas quite L-Ivn:y CHAS. K. LIPMAN, Secretary. H - for $1.000.00, payable to the ordes

S .. at other holders desiring to ng wide range in quality and vaiue String § ———~ . e e — ! n - C she CIty of Naw B
October o e N o * ve mold fatrly but prices continue low. Squash MANHATTAN RAILWAY COMPANY. | **Bonas e o e Bl

November. - .\‘._I u]l. i : th ten “” hall do s pr ¥ . ; ¢ atoes weak and decidedly ) lower Other lnto.—k.‘.\{.un:h‘ (Rapl: Trnnsnxo n{:;{.{;n.dl.emc. cortieod 5 o The incstes Ty Ghe Uulel
: BUSE Mgk a0 her asgents wili be received at the offices of !+ i ““"".T“?’,‘ Long »e. 18 PA.:':e-ﬁ;’:ur\gpr‘\_A::;ers,: KQ:':b:: Stb, 1907 Mortgage and Trust Company, including the optnhlmol

s sl MORGAN & (O, 23 WALL STREET. NEW as $1 75@82 12, do ‘ . g e "3 three- | COunsel as to the validity

b etandard f $1! do long. $150@ The guaranteed quarterly dividend of one an e No bid of less than par value of the bonds will te

YORK: J. 8. MORGAN & €0, 22 OLD BROAD N var Bhl. $1 254 quarters per cent. on the capital stock of the Manhat-
i sy e m{rfm},;ﬂ tan Railway Company will be paid on and after Tues- "’;f:"r""'l’dr R‘;"{;';‘ muse “’; ";’ zjﬂa‘:\d form of
¢ day. October 1st. 1907, to stockholders of record at the | Proposal furnisse ¥ the undersign ccrued

! STREET, LONDON, and ADOLPH BOISSEVAIN &
{ €O, AMSTERDAM, to and fncluding the I14TH | S . S@1dc: S, per 100 | o he tramader Booh Friday, September | t°T*st to be pald by the purchaser. and delivery will be
| DAY OF SE :  CARROTE, BT L To0%. at 3 orclock PML T P pode st fhe olies of e O T T
saniss of £ % N e e T . The transfer books will be reonened nn Wednesday, ochelis on the I5th day of September.
,‘\f Ao Ao Ipeow: af wasant o $0c; CABBAGES. Fist Dutch. per Soplemhorlﬁ.'-th. 1907, at 10 o'clock A. M. ~ The right {z reserved to refect any or all bide
such ertension, may be obtained at those offices and S::\--,h. 34; .'k?s‘;{'isl‘l"" ‘;' D. W. McWILLIAMS, Treasurer. Dated New Rocheila N. V.. Augnust 29, 1007
per bushel basket @ sl o - e e il S Clar'e
ri J. PIERPONT MORGAN, 1.000, §2@$3. do Jersey and — CHARLES KAMMERMEYER. City B
in the comtrel ). BRUCE ISMAY siase UMBERS, Shelter The Union Bag & Pﬂ.r C .
Rvelr firm and o . e EO B3 Rhy ¢ S 34th Quarterly Dividend.
o j E = Voting 50@$2 50. do Long Island and Jer- & =~ . : r BOND SALE.

positions were 11 to 13 p | PIRRIFE, v £125. do No. 17 Battery Plac '.r._.\rl'r !ork‘.: slevt!.\l% 1001'-“ OF NEW H ~ ¥

! rustees. . =9, O Y IND OF ONE (A CEN' on tha CITY ROCHELLE, N. .

| A DIVIDE L e ) FEE Realed proposals will ha received by the City Cleri

Preferred Stock of The T'nion Bag & Paper Company

A B WIDENER,
has this day been declared, pavabie Octobar 15th, 1907, c A

CHARLES STEFLFE,

s office {n the ¢ Hall Buiiding, corner of Malin
. > T Meachanic Streets, 10 8 o'clock p m.. Tuesday,
. n1f:'u:'7’( ord at the close of business on e ¥ 19973, for the purchase of all or l.!::hwe
T he transfer books for the preferred stock will close | of $17.134.32. Registered five per cent Local way
> 7 Improvement Bonds. series of 1907, of eaid City, of

at 200 P. M., September 3Mh, 1907, and reopen at $1 000 00 each, except that one of said bonds

10ne Was #leal)

The fine

do per bas-

'a W X, 303 40c; 1 TUCE, state, per 0 M. Oc Sth, 0T

basket ar box e. LIMA BEANS, Jersey, potato, TG0 5 N b "“'- 1. SPARKS, Sec'y for the sum of $1.138 32, date] September 14, 1807, and
per basket 1d and Jersey, po- Sl I . s Sesimasiassandiiadetey BECT Maturing $5.000.06 on the firsr day of x.;‘.l’ 1917;

iy per basket, MERGENTHALER LINOTYPE COMPANY. 5.000.00 on the first day of Mav. 1918, and 37.138
. per basket, New York., September 160, 1907 first day of Mayv. 1919 Inter payabie semi-
per ™, 40c @ At a meating of the Board of Directors heid this nr on the first days of Novemb and May: prin-
and yeliow, per | dav a reguiar quarterly dividend of two and one-haif | * PO a ’: interest payable at the office of the City

Shelter Tsiand, per cent. was declared, payable on and after Sapt. 30, ired

do red. $150@8%2: do Lo 1807, to the stockholders of record on Saturday, Sept ‘1’-1}"“ proposal must be accompanied by a certifial
per bhl, $150@82 25 14. 1907, at one o'clock P. M - check on an incorporated bank or trust cempany in the
i SR e 5 $2: do Jer rhe tranafer books will ciose en Saturday, Sept. 14 | State of New York for §1.500.00. payable to the order

781. do # 1907. at one o'ciock P. M., and reopen om Tuesday, of the City Treasurer of the City of New Rochelle
Bonds will be engraved under the supervision of and

il he made in the
r Oct. 1, 1907, at 16 o’cioc) v
e ro g ot T X004, & certified ns ta their genuineness hy tha TUnited States

A M
yor erate, 50¢ DK J. W TRTON. easurer. R
commanded O - ,,X”r&;,‘“‘(;‘ "?,,.“ i e 4,‘,\_' S ?T ZI_,,_“____ Mortgage and Trust Company. including the opinion
motices were fret isgued infica "do red. $1@81° { New York & Harlem Raliroad Co. of\gnu}n;‘-l Tl""'h:.“l"mi..u, of e s il e
‘P YER . < - s - No bid of less than par f the bon
PEPPERS, Jers Treasurer's Office, New York, September Tth, 1807 considerad Bidders must use the printed form of pro-
an

had heen discounted. Copsequentit
Y= Jess thap 50 points it ht
price of contracts, while sh
2+ suight go pesrer 8 parity wiin m
P The range of contract prices I

—— Gzay was as foliows:

signed Accrued interest
a aividend of two per cent. ¢27%) on the Preferred and | to be paid by the purch and Aritvery will be made
Common ftock, pavable on the first day of October next ! at the ofica of the easurer in New Rochelle on
to etockh ers of record mt the close of business en | the 25th day of September. 1807
Saturday, the l4th day of Reptember, 1907 The right is reservad to raject any or all bids
MILTON S. BARGBR, Treagurer. Dated New Rochelle. N Y. August 29, 1907

— - — —e—ee—g} CHAR KAMMERMEYER. Ciy Clerk
AMERICAN CAN COOMPANY. e - i

A quarterly dividend of One and One-quarter Fer Cent :
(1% ") has been decared upon the Preferred Stocrk of BOND
this Company, payable on October Ist, 1807, to Stock-
holders of record at the ciose of business September 17th, Eeale
. 1907 The Praferred Stock transfer books will be closed | at his
Eouth | from September 18th to October 1st, 1907, beth inclusive, and Mec? :
. per small | Checks wiil be mailed. September 137, 1
rutabagna er bbl, $19 R H. ISMON, Secretary. | of $25.000.00, Registered five per cent. Street Improve-
nches. $22$3: WATER- Dated, New York.,* August 26th, 1907. | ment Bonds. series of 1907. of said Clty, of $1.000.00
@81 - < e = = —— ———— | each. dated September 1§ 907, and maturing $5.000 00
—_— RA",.*WA} RTEEL—!I’RI".\'G COMPANY, | on the first day of May. 1 agel $3.000.00 on the first

5 alway, New York, st 22nd, 1907 | days of May, 1919 1821, 1¥ il 1923, . Intagest pay-

LIVESTOCK MARKET. A quarterly dividend of ONE AND THREE-QUAR- | ahie sem! nnualiv on the first davs of November and
g 1.082 head TERS PER CENT. (1%°%) has this day been declared v: principal and interest payable at the oMce of the
on the Preferred Stock of this Company, payabla Sep- | ity Treasurer
. 1807, to stockholders of record September Fach proposal must be accompazied by a ecertified
1007, at Mesars. Harvey Fisk & Sons, 62 Cedar | -peck on an incorperatad bank or frust company n

New York City the State of New York for $2.000.00.. payable to the
nsfer Books of the Preferred Stock will ba closed | grger of the City Treasurer of the City of New Ro-

b1, Tn"?:,‘!.;: The Board of Directors of this Company has declared | posal furnished by
=

LR LIRG
basket, 40 @ 50c. do per b
3 York. per bhasket
IADISHES. nearby

Seprerher
CITY OF NEW ROCHELLE. N. Y.

I be receivéd by the ity Clerig
City Hall Building, corner of Main
reets, up to § o'clock p. m. Tuwesday,
3. for the purchase of all or any part

], per 201

Recaipts wera

cars for slau

beef  Liverpool and

ware quotably un mber 10th and raopened an September 2ist, 1807 | chelle
SO0 cattisa on the RAILWAY STEE?ZSPHII\W.; (8 ')(_PA.\’Y Bonds will be engraved under the supervision of and
X :'\‘“F & Son _and F. CARNAHAN. Treasurer. certified gs to their genuineness by the Unitad States
r ag i T Morris Beaf Com- | = — — e — | \iortgage and Trust Company, fncluding the opinion of
candled, 14@15c about 3 900 quar- counsal as to the validity

No bid of less than par value of the bonds will be

a out to

bbls and crates cranberries
1 ed between

) movement
? aie light mixed, $8 20G98 45; choice lig
‘:,' . e ,:,. Ipts €or the week, hild | 188 60, packing, $5 50§48 20 $3@$6 25: bulk | constdersd Bidders must use the printed form of pro-
. will ales, §5005%8 43 SHEEP ts. about 18,000 | poeal furnished by the unlersigned. Accrued interest
., $3 SOG$S 50, rearlings, $5 75 | to be paid by the purchaser and deltvery will be mads

o e e 8 of bast dalxi arket strong

te plenty, but demand the Swift B " Morrd .
: g et - h prices showir b« - A the Morris Beef Company a t the e of the City Treasurer in New Rochells on
AL —Flour was Rangoon and. M- . e St Jower Peis PP e ol o e e It aver- s mbav's:eﬁ HOGS quiet; butchers’ and W gz:ﬁzﬂf-\- .it September. 1907
prices firm and u i e lums have sccumulated a el a‘,""’,': Ib; & bulls, 72% Ib, at $3 35, 3 | pers, $6 (0GS6 65, common, $3 25@$8 30. CATTLE steady | The right is reserved to reject any or all bids
"y 29 fopments of » ¥ . large quantities cleaning up at 3@8c per | Uo7 VES Recelpts were 8 i to strong: falr to good shippers, $3 70885 75; cemmon, | Dated New Rochelle. N. Y. August 29, 1907.
Joblere are l“‘! placing ! ¢, regardiess of varlety Grapes have """'.1'. 5" ¢ lu'v,' making. with the calves ov -"r.\-e";lr;g:vm;:; v 2":““ - SHEEP steady at $225@$5. LAMBS steady | CHARLES KAMMERMEYER. City Clerk
change® ] Aers just mow. and - ! declined K cranberries commencing 10 arrive | o5 gale  Strictly good 4 1@ veals were in de- §3 854 5. l e pabia = ==
= Wwinter straights. £4 10@%140. wi on old orders ., Blackberries huckleberries nearly out of market | mjand and s triflea firm: medium and common veals | DVERTISEMENTS and su for The T
- ! ra lons have con duil and many neaded, buttermilks grassers and EUROPEAN PRODUCE MARKET. “&_ received at thelr Uptown O No. 1384 Broadway.

8375, spring clears, $3 5@ 84 25 sugar for tb

r people, :
low

quality
. nominal; | between 36th and 3ith sts.. untii § o'clock p._m.  Adver—

extra No 2 wint they are willing to do Jobhers will take out . = Watermel : rse a n Western calies wersa not w .
é unted : Fair 1 Py el s g - re N i a = Y K wanted, iverpool, Eept. 10 —Closing-WHEAT—Spot
By QU @85 15. CORNMEAL firm: | O0l3 st gz, Setiow- ' o85: ,nlf',i | ery few chauged hands to-day and pricas were !u{ures"plfn"ad'- g Se;lv mber. 1 6% Decerber, 789isd. | tisements recefved at the following branch offices at reg-
>, T3 BAG MEAL steads: | 188 an ts and R & ot bt - ower. at 400 head were lkels e held over. | yMarch, 7s9%d. CORN—Spot firm: American mixed, | ular office Tates until § o'clack p. m.. viz.: 254 Sth ave.
S wibied il cnarse, $126@ ! a Crystal SCBAL APPLES Barti “‘ . - | Poor to choice veals sold at §5399 per 100 1b: | new ©s3d. futures quist. September and October, | s e cor. 234 st.; 153 6th ave. cor. 12th st : 92 East l4th
= - ite an et | a loaf and $2@$3 §0;: PEAR Sritect. per DB . k throwouts’” at $4. fed calves at $3 poorest 10 | fe5id. PEAS -Canadian firm et 6s11%d.  FLOUR - | 8t 257 Wast 424 st.. between 7th and Sth aves : 263 West
o TED—Western 2 cubes, 53%c; XXXX lo per bushel hasket. §! 50@ 2; Qu-'." ApP'S | best buttermilks and grassers at $2 . the two \\'uw‘ pm,n',, steady at 28s. HOPS in Lendon (Pacific | 125th st | 1338 3d ave., between 76th and T7th
| » § yags powdered and Eagle . per bbl 5 o06 ST v per keg, $1 r.'v @82 ‘o , cars of Western were among the “holge Dressad - .’." sienty at i2 5sBE3 REEF-Extra India mess eve., mear 6lst st.: 1708 Ist ave. near SPth st.o
. | confectioners’ granulated, 5 2%c; powdered, coarse pow- | ¥lemish Beauty, per bbl, $3G$4. do sugar. $3@85; do | calves quiet at S@p13ic per Ib for city dressed veals "OT-{ at Ws. PORK —-Prime mess, Western, stgady at 125tk st.: 756 Tremont ave. : 650 34 ave.
- | dered and fruit powdered and Eagle coarse and extra  Scooter. $3@ $4 An or¢ ary summer sorts, $2 50@284; - and T@10c for country dressed ;“3'1 t"\ﬁls--ﬂhnrl cut, 14 to'ls I, easy at S0s. | = =
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