
tn 30 acrea. The Iniprovementa on thi. of Dona Ana, State of New Hesieo, in
and cnm.it if houae and tencinc. value rront oi me court nouie i.

See. 26, T. I5S.. It 20W., containing 14,
202.93 acres. The improvementa on this land
consist of tank and fencing, value $4070.

Sale No. 468, All of Sees. 4, 3, Lota 1,
Inwina ileacriheH irirti of land. Via!

Dollar. ($3 00) per acre the appraised value SEtf Sec. J All of See. I, NEtf, NVaSEtf.
thereof and the successful bidder will be re- - SWtfSEX Sec 1L NEK, SW, NHSEJ4,
:he total amount offered by him lor these M.l. Sec 14, SM bee. IS, All oi Sees,
landa. 22, 23, E!i WtfWX Sec. 26, EH. NHNW54

Sale No. 501, All of Sec. 36. T. IBS., K. UWH Sec. 27, HV.. SF-- Sec. 35, All of Sec 36, T.
Lois 2, J, 4, Sec. 1, T. 19S., R. 13W., contain. 21 S.. R. IIW., NySNEM Ses. 1 T. 22S, B.

$435.

There ara o Improvements on thia land.
Sale 390, NriSWt Sec 1, NtfNWi 8m.

10, N'NH Sec. 11, SHSH Sec. 12, T. Hit,
R. 32F... SX NW(i, SWJ Sec 23, SE KM,
EVjSK, Sec 2s, T. 32N., R. WE., SWjZ
Sec. 27. T. 32N., R. 32E. containing MM
acres. There are no improvementa oo thta
land.

Sale 391. SWKSEK, N54SE, SEMSWM
Sec. 4, NWKSWX Sec. 5, T. 25N., Ii. nC

Sale N. 407, Lota 1. 2, 3, 4. 5, 6, 7,
8. 9, 11, NEH Sec. 21, T. 22S., R. 4E.. con- -

taining 534.77 acrra. There are no improve-ment-

on thia land.

Z, 3, EWWH, SEtf Sec 5, t:KW, Nr.
SWK. El-- Sec. 8, NH. NtfStf, SWHSW
Sec. 9, S'i. SWK, KSEja Sec 10. NW

No bid on the above described tracta of
land will be accepted for Ina than Three
Dollara (WOO) per acre, which ia the ap-

praised value thereof.
The above aale of landa will be subject

"K o.au acres, mere arc no improvements iiw., containing H3W.54 aer-- a. .he Improve
menta on thia land coneiat of houae. corral.

for less than Three well, wind mill, lank, and fencing, value' wswi'!S''N5'' NSWX. SEX) S- - H StS4 N bid will accepted
a4?" ?a.3fc.V'eA' 2wJvw2 i? Sec. id, cyjisr-v- Sec. 17, SEliSEK Sec W.I Dollar. ia.uu, per acreto the following term, and conditiona, vir:

The aucceiaful biddera
commissioner of Pub!

me appraisea value silMa.
must Pay to the Sec 1, 11, S',NEH. Sec th. reol and the successful containing 210 ThereS'. NWNKS, 24. N!' SES,, bidder will be re- - ,1 acrea. are no improve- -

No bH ,h. .bov. d.rib.jic Landa. or hie agent 12. T. 2SS., R. 3E., containing 39.93 acrea.s E!NEj NKrjSEK See. tr, SVVX quirrd to cash or certified exchanae'i j ?. tracta on tha anrf.
of the price. The improvement, on tM. land consist ol

U,
NK j.Krw NESW, NWKSE.sec total amount offered by . m for thU Dollars ($3 00) .f'ler. which i.'lhJ L'tr 39r?' NNWJ, SWHNWX Sec M,

v,, s.c 33, All of Sec. 34, T. loS., R. landa. 3IE.. containing 120 acrea. There
hoi, tin, ...eh malm.

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

SIERRA COUNTY

Office o! the CommiMtoner of Public Lands,
Santa Fe, New Mexico, Augu.t 4, 1916.

Notice is hereby given that puriuant to
the provisions of an Act of Coniires., Ap-

proved June 20, 1910, the laws of the State
f New Mexico, and the rulea and regula-

tion of the State Land Office, the
of Public Landa will offer at Public

Sale, to the higheat bidder at 9 o'clock
A. M on Thursday, Oober 26th, 1916, in
the town of Hillsboro, County of Sierra,
State of New Mexico, in front of the court
kooae therein, the following described tracta

offer..! l.v .hem rr.nectivelv for the landt a surface tank, value $300.
4 per cent interrat in advance for the Sale No. 409, SJ4 Sec J, ES Sec , jiVy are no improvement, on thi. land.

'ii ' ' Sa,e No- - E,4W ,4' Ew. Wi Sale No. 444. All of Sec W. T. OS., R.NhM hec. T. 163., R. W, con- - cw,: cr n auvwu HlViKCU T w ,n ri..i. ibalance of such purchaae onces; the lees H'A Sec. 10, All of Sec. 11, All of bee. 14, sow. Sale 393, tiH Sec. 24, NEK Sec 2J, T.
2SN., R. 30E containing 480 acre.. There
are no improvement, on this landJnl'ri'Sj.t.T'of "rr." !"S" R- 12W- - ""'"i"1" - There 'r. on thi. land,'

fencina:, .ae thi. land.n impruvemeni. on t jSale Nn 9. NRUSRU Ser M T I7S No ,he ,bove de,,.,);,,,! ,rlct (

for advertising ana appraisement ann an Sec. 17, All of Sec. 23, T. Z4S.. K. w.,
cost, incidental to the sale herein, and each containing 3200 acres. There are no improve-an- d

all of said amount!, must be depoaited menta on this land. Sale 394, Ky,tt.y. Sec. 23, NtfSWJ, SEM
U. 13W., containing 40 acre.. The improve-- 1 No bid will accepted for h it than Three

' ''" accepted (or lets than Ten SWJ4 Sec. 24,T. 25N., R. 30K., containingin cash or certified ecnange at toe time 01 g f No 410i Sl.c. x N,r S,c. y
24S., R. 3W., S! Sec. 10, AH of Src. menu on thit land contirt of (eochifsale, aim wiiilu iaiu ...,,... huu u, p l'!!ars per acre the appraised value "onari irio.uu; per acre, wntcn is tne ap- - w acres. mere are no improvement, on

thereof and the successful hiH.ler will he r. praised value thereof. this land.lllem are sunjeci lo lunriiure. lu mc ia.Btc ... Sec. All o! ac. cie irig, Tiiue a
ol New Mexico If the successful bidder, do y

SJ'jlVKM,
'sEV' S,NE!4 Sec'

25.
27, All of Sees! Sale No. 470. SySSEH. SWJ4 Sec. 25. T. ' " yj vi. wi wnmru cuiudkc ine aoove sale oi lanas will or .uojeci yr y ' J.'7

m jq m n 'I le w .wmwm u nur n . iu. wi NLtMuri. wix ""r ,u I'ar in hniii gr uerimcu rxi.niaue in inr loiiowinir lerm. inn rnnnn nni. viz; 711' " n tic. 1. a. vwmmw- -of land, vu
Sale No. 445, Lot J, Ntswit bcc. tg. aiier 11 mi u m.ueu ... ..c. u, Sec. 15, NWtfSEtf, SiSEK, ESV. A Sec. s. 31, T. 16S., R..16W., Lota L 2, 3. 4, n' total amount ottered By him tor these The successful bidders must pay to thei,n8 acres. mere are no improvementa

T. IIS., R. 7W., containing 83.42 acre.. There State Land Office, .aid loitract to provide A of Scc 25 pj NE wNW'Sj, S, SENEtf Sec. 6, T. 173.. R. WW., eonta.il.. ,and- - commissioner of Public Lands, or his airent " "' d- -

art no improvements on th-- s land. f"r ,ht payment ot tne Balance ot tne pur. S(C x rVi S(.c T 24S f 5W ( mM acr,., 1 ,. improvements un tint The above sale of lands will be subject holding such sale, of the pricee! Sale 397 Lots 3, 4, SV5NW5,, SH Sec t.
Sale No. 446, NtfSEK Sec. 9, N.SEJ1 chased price, of said tracta ol land mrT t.ninine; 7471. 02 acres. There are no itn- - d con.i.t of fencing, value $46S.TJ to the following terms and condition., viz: ""d hy them respectively for the land; NEK, EkiNWK, NWtfNWX Sec 1 Kyi

Sec 11. T. US.. R. 8W., containin equal, annual payments, with interests on emrnt, . ,hi, 1nn. "The successful bidders must pay to the P" cent interest in advance for the Scc. 11, T. 2dN.. R. 34E., containing 1079.11
Krca. There are no improvements on thi., all deferred payment a at the rate of lour Snr No 4)) w4 Src j, T rs R. o M M WUWI TIM commissioner of Public Land., or hi. agent h'lsnre d such purchase prices; the fees acre.. The improvements on thi. land CM- -

land. t" " P" J""' .tVJl 1W-- . W54 Sec. 26. All of Sec. 19, 29. E'i, J' ?v' s's Sec 7 SiiSec 8 hn,,,i'' : of the prices, 't advertising and appraisement and alls,,t of iencing. value $125.00. -
eachSale No. 447. EHSEtf Sec. , T. US., R. and interests October v ' A, o( s.c f. 25S., R. .J'J svi 9 NWMSW SMSWlk Se? ""'r"i b " Ptively for the land; co,., incidental to the sale .leretn, and each1

yjS , , E,.NWVl
containing 80 acrea. These are no year, and such other nd.tuns, nbliRat on. 2 T 25S R--, all of .aid be s,5 nSneS:tW., be A in T jks 15W containing 16 .crec " cent i"lt in advance fo th an amounts, must deposited src 19 Lot 1 NENWia

improvements on this land. reservations and terms as may required ,w See. 5. NE! Sec. 8. T. 26S.. R. n;in rovements'or Md coi rf ha,anF' o( ,uch P"ha.e prices; the fee.: in cash or certified echange at the time of s.'V.NFV Vc ) f 27N R. cootita!
Sale No. 448, NSWK Sec. 11. T. IIS., R. by law. ,W. All of Sees. 6, 7, 18, T. 26S., R. 2W.. ,' "in7P 75 ,nr flvertiin and appraUement and all aale. and which said amount, and all of " r Tli're are" no imoroXeTt.

!W., containing 80 acres. There are noi r.rh of the tracts as described herein All of Sees. 1, 12. 13, T. 26S.. R. 1W.. con-- .,'.,,. . costs incidental to the sale nercn, and each "'" are sul.jrct to forfeiture to the State hj, .c
improvements on this land. .will be offered separately. taining 9102,62 acres. There are no ira-- , .

', hw'V??;A.c.':' ' 7 wmJ a" ' "i'1 amounts, must be deposited ' ' New Mexico if the successful uidders do ,' ,
Sale No. 449, S',SEX Sec. 17, T. 13S., R. The Commissioner of Public Lands of New ,,r, .lem.-nl- on this land. '''i NJ:M; ,S'.C- - N.J? in cash or certified echanue at ihe time of execute s contract within thirty days n.Sul'h!3v'-1- L"''.. n.MSWii onSec. It,

7V7.. containing 0 acres. The improvementa Mexico, or his agent holding auch sale,. Sale No. 412, All of Sec. 36, T. I9S., fc'.NWH- - NMJ Sec. 8. W,NVH o'C T. a, which tai.l amounts and all of'l("'r ' h" been mailed th?m by the l'h.
iAK- - containing 126.80 acres.

are no improvements on thia land.this land consist of surface tank and ri.a,.rvrs the riRht to reject any and all 4W.. E',NEM. NF.'4SEK Sec. 1, All of Sec.il"s- - R. l'W., containing B00 acres. There tli.tr are subject to forfeiture to th- - State ilffice, said contract to provide S.il
MN

40TJ, E'AK!4. NKSE'4 Sec. 33, T.
R. 29E., cnntain'ng 120 acres. Thenlencintf. value flM. bins offered at said sale. Possession miter F",SF.4, SWNE, NWV,SE, SE5SEK, lr nr improwmems ou mis lan 1. n,.w Mexico if the succesidil bidders do "r ""' payment of the balance of the pur.

Sale V- - 450, HWJ Sec. 27, SF'4 Ser. L11ntracts of salt for the above described Sec. 10, NwjiNWH Sec 11, NWH No. 473, SE(,NWX Sec. 12, SW n t execute a contract within thirty days ''In ml prices of said tracts of land in thirty
28. T. US.. K. !W containinR 0 acres. ,n w,l Be given wlimn miriy uaya.wvu Sec. 15. All ol Sec. 16, KKSW4,,MVM, VasVll, VYWr.K Se; 11. Si.iuci it nas neen mailed to inem bv the:"illa' annual payments, witn interests on

SKUXWtf. NEK Sec. 19. N', Sec. 20. T. N",. N',S', Sec. 14. W'iNSW. SEMNEVt State Land Office, saiil -- ontract to rirovi.le all deferred payments at the rate of fourThe improvements on inis iano innnii "'.atter date 01 sate.
ionse, barn, storehouse, two wells, two wind- - W'itmis my hand and the official seal of

mills, to tanks, orchard, and fencing, value the State l and Office thi. 4th day of Auguit,
$(775. A. V., 1910,

451. Lot 4 Sec. 6. T. 155.. R. i ROUT. P. ERVTHNSale cio.

20S., R. 4W., containing acrea. The NISW, SWtfSWS Sec. 24, T. ICS.. K. f'r the payment of the balance of the pur. l"r Pf annum, in advance, payments
improvements on thia landconsitt of H W., containing 7(i1 acres. The improve-- ! chased prices ol said tracts of land in thirty 1n'' interests due on October 1st of each

mints on this laud consist of two well., equal, annual payment., with interests on year, and such other conditions, obligation..
Sate No. 413, All of Sec. 2, T. 27S., R.: value $50. all deferred payment, at the rate cf four '' 4' r' all jus and terms as may be required

2W.. SWM Scc. 35, T. 26S., R. 2W.. con-- , Sl N 474 E, .SKU, SW'NKH, NWH T"'r. r."" ''r a"num- - in advance, payments;1 'aw.

taining 801.56 acres. The improvement, on SK'iSWtl Sec 5 Fv;NWl4 W!,SKy4 in interests due on October 1st of each Each of the tracts as described herein
this land cinsist of 2 wells, 2 wind-mill- i;, c 8 Sic 17 T. 19S. R 11W., yi'ar' " !' "'r c"nditmn, obligations. wil' b, ff. t,-- . siparatcly.
2 pumping plants, cement tanks, corrals ,,,'t ai nisi 440.1K aires. 'There are no im- - r''s,,rv"ns and as may he required T'ie on miniom-- of puhlic Lands of Srw

1W.. At! of Sec. 36. T. HS., R. 2W., con Commissioner of Public Line's.
t.lnini i 37 acres. The improvements on State ol New Mexico.

are no improvement s on this land.
Sale 4111, K',SW, SWSFtf Sec. 4, N(4.

SW'i. WWSEK Sec. 9, N' SEW Sec W.
S"i. W",NW4 c. IS, NEMNKli Sec. M.

S'tKW'A, NiiSKH Sec. 22. T. 25N.,
Ii 32E contamtng 19..1J acres. There are
no itnptovenients on this land.

Sale 402, WO. W!.KS See. 3J. T. 24N.,
K. JE., conlamtng 489 acres. There are
no improvements 011 tl.is land.

S.,le m, IV1-,- . NE'i Sec. W, T. 26N , R.
tl K. , cotitainint: WW acres. The in.pruvements ou this lands consist of fencing value
Wil.lU

Sale 4114 F.1 '.. !W'J Sec. 2, K!'i, SWSjSWKi,
X' .SVVI4. sKSS4i S. c. 3. NWUN'LW, SKI

'.hia land consist of fencing, value $281.25. first Pnl licatton Auerust 11, 1916.

Sale No, 452, NERF.V Sec. 22, SWSF.'I.,, Publication October 20, 1916.

SEytNWX. Sec. 23, T. US., R. 8W., containing V 'aw. hi-- a'i-n- t holding suchand fencing, value $7500. this land.provements
No hid on the above described tract, of , .. ... , . ,. ..,.,.,.., r " "'. "T 'raeis as dcscnoe.l herein r .in s riul.t to reject any and all

liMs ut'fered at sail sale. .Possession under
nntracts if sale frr the above

nale "yimvot, wi II bt ollered separately.Im.l he for less than Tore.
M ar, "fil m nerP acre, which i. the .S,c- & Commissioner of Public Land, of New

R. 11W., l ots 1. 2, hb.HNh.Vi, E,SfcJs, Mi xico, or his aB. nt bidding such sale v. he Kivtn within thirty daispraised value thereof.

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

SWJSf.H. Sec. 1. W"i scc. , reserves the rich! to reject any and all iff r date of sai
V.y,. Lot 3, Sec. 6, T. IRS., R. IIW., con- - ,, offered a N'- KM. SWXsaid sale issession under Witne ss my hand and the official seal of Ktf.
( lining L279.10 acres. The improvements on contract, of .ale for the above described the Slate I and Ofl.cc this 4lh dav of nugu.t.

XK'- EWNW54. SWNWH Sec 10. NEH
tin. land consist of fencing, value $700. tract, will be given within thin. .1... A 1) tin. s,,SWl Srik.VWVa. NEMSWM

Sale No. 414, SUNWH Sec. 2, T. 22S., R.

3F.., containing 80 acres. There are no im-

provements on this land. No bid on the
above described tract of land will be ae.
cepted lor less than Ten Dollars ($10.00)
nee which la the auoraised value

LINCOLN COUNTY.

JD acres, mere are no improvement, vm

thia land.
Sale No. 453, SW'iSF.'i, SEVjSW'4 Sec.

14, NEKNW5Scc. 23, T. US., R. 8W., contain-in-

120 acres. There are no improvement.
Mi this land.

Sale No. 454. Tt 4, SWtfNWtf Sec. 4. Lot.
1. S Ser. 5. S'.NWH Sec. 9, SWKNF.M Sec.
M, T. US, R. 8W., containing 307.54 acre..
Tte improvements on thi. land consist of
fencing, value $60.

Sale No 455, SEtfNEtf See. 10, T. US., R.

8W., containing 40 acres. There are no
this land.

Sale No 156, NHNF.5,, NNW5, SWKNWK,
3WV, NWSEK, S!,SE5 Sec2, All of Sec
3, 4, EV1 Sec. 5, E, Sec. 8, All of Sec

, 10, NK. NSX Sec. 15. All of Sec 16,

Sale No. 476, 7, S.C. 6. l.ot 1, SEX aff r date of lale. ROHT. P. ERVfEN s"'' 21 ' K' c""u,",n 1716

NW. SWANKS. W1-:- SEM. E'iSWK Wnnci. my lian.l and the official ,cal of. Commissioner of Public i.an Is. ;"'r'i- Tl""r" arc "" improvement, on thia

7, Lot 2. K".NW'4, W!,NE( S. -.-. 18, T. the State Land Office this 4th day of August, Slate of New Mexico.
IKS., R. 13W., containing 524.51 acres. The A. D., 1916. Firt PtiSlication August 11, 1916. N" bid will be accepted for lets than FiveOffice of the Commissioner of Public Land., thereof.

Santa Fe, New Mexico, August 4, 1916. Sale No. 41S, Lots 3, 4, Sec 2, T. 22S., R.... . . tF enntninrnv Rfi 12 acres. There ire no improvements on this land consist ol ttneing,. . tviiiu. i r.KVlKN i I't.l.hcation Uctohcr20. I91u. I"'lu" v- a1 ",' ' '"e aijpiai.eavalue thereol..iuiiin3ioui;r 01 ruoucNotice is hereby given tnat pursuant toi. ' " '.." .1,:. -j Uai;i --l. vauie
the provision, of an Act of Congress. Ap. VI""'"" ,lt. ' T I'S R. State of New Mexico.J7? All of Sec.

I ii i r uuiii ai ion ciiimi!.! ii, cmijThe i

Sale 405, WSF.tf Sec. 32, T. 30N., R.
2'iE . cntaitiini,' Ku acres. There re no
improvements on this land. No btd on
this land will he accepted lor less than
Ten ri..llara fSWllIll ,,,-- r acre u,lm-l- i 1. thm

Otrtoher 2U. lyievalue
proved june 2U, ivn , ne haw, ot ,or ,h,n Ten Dollar. ($10.00) containing W2 .32 acre..
?LVrf"hT.fe"dUnd o!nce.h.'m:n acre, which i. ,h. appraised value there-Un- ot. this laud, cun.is, of fencin

missioner of Public Lands will offer at Public; '

State of New Mexico.

NOIILfc FOR PUHLIC A IIUIM

Pfllt.IC LAND SALE

UNION COCNTY

Sale No. 478. E;4 Sec. 19, N54 SWM. NW!Sale, to the higheat bidder at 9 o'clock,! The above sale of lands will he subject
a xf Fpid.iv. October mth. 1916. im to the following terms and conditions, viz:

Sec. 17, I.ot 1, , J, s, iiiwivi,rNEM 18. EJ4, SWS, SEHNWX Iot. I,

2 Sec. 19, All of Sees. 21. 22. N Sec 28,

Si Sec. 29, All of Sec. 30, W!S, SF.tf Sec.
SEtf, SWKSEH See. 20, NWX Sec 29, NF
Sec. 30. T IhS., R. 1W., containing 1240the town of Carrizozo. Count, of Lincoln. The auccessful bidders must pay to thai

appraised value thereof.
Sale No. 406. NE. SWtf, NSEX. SEM

SEM, Sec 1; SEM Sec. 2; T. 23N., R. 35E

WSi, SEM. Sec 6; Nr4, Vc J; T. tltt..
R. 36E, All of Sec. 36, T. 24 N., R. 36E,
containing 204.35 acre.. The improvemeat.

SIA1E OF NEW MF.XfCO

NO UCe FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

Tli. t arc no improvements on thisJt T I7S" R. 7W., containing 8477.11 acre. State of New Mexico, in front of the court commissioner of Public Lands, or hi. agent acres.
m A ,1.1. lan.l consist ot.llouse tnerein. tne loiowtna- - ueicrioca tract, noiuinx sucn sale, 1,1 inc bihii a.....

1 f lot land, .if loffered by them respectively for the land; Sale No. 479, NF.MSWtf, SE5I; S- e- ;i, SEJd
sev Ciiwt ci See 25 All of, c.l. w. its II All nl Sees i4 4 Per ccnt interest in auvance tor tneR, S', Sec. 22, T. IDS., K. 14W., contain-- police is hereby given that pursuant to on tne.e lano. consist oi e wen, winas.au.eiTn slSFti of such the fees LUNA COVHTY. the of Act of Conpress. and fencing, value. $725.00. No bid wall ta T IBS R 7W All of Sec , W.SWK N See 22 NFta1 balance purchase prices: ia,, acre,. There arc no improvement. provision, an ap-

3'i, and .11 Office of the Commissioner ol Publtc Lands, proved 1910 the laws of the State for lea. than whsaaf fUFU Sec 9 NNFi, q' Sec 24 Nr5 Sec 27 All of '"r adverti.ing and appraisement ,r , hi, land. June 20, accepted $5.00 per acr

Mwpl W SFW Sec 10 Ail of' Sees, w Sfm FSWli S 29
'

KE'4 K'i Incidental to the sale her-i- and each! Sale No. 4h0. W'iSWH. SWM Se-- 26.! Santa Fe Ntw Mexico, August 4. !!.; of New Mexico, and the rule, and rcgula- - i. the appraised value thereof.

W W Sec 15, All 3' T 6S R 16E ! containing ' '' amounts, must be deposited S'i. MSWH. E',SF.!. NWMSEH Sec 27,1 .
h,rpb iv(.n ,ha, pura, , ." of the State Land Of ,ce. the Lomrnis- -

T, bov(! , f , w, be ,ubjK,it Sec.S16 S"SEM Sec. 20, All of Sec 22, ".crc There are B Imp.eBt. o- - L'Znunf. '"m Mli'Ti W?EAiE- of Congre... Ap- - i 7e SoSL'rdgheT.'1 bim'le'r Vock ' h term, and condition.. :

S,.e 1 All of Sec. 24. ii,;. lA "t'c n(" which T. IBS., , i,ln. vi loin ihe laws of the Stateii is c"" . ,,V ' T he suceessfu bidders must pay to the

2V W'ASWM Sec. 25, E.NEVi Sec 26. T. SWUWU StHSYni NEUSEM SWM
P

; ",LP... T-- lVt W ,conH.', " s ,1,- - No 46 S' S'N", See. 7. S. RV SWK Sec. 4, All of S.-- 5. K'A, NWSEH them are subject to forfeiture to the Stat.

" "iay be require! VWIi 30. .r:rUtr aSreJ 0'" aAVa l'O, M
llnd consYst of house stables, cor-- : ' he. iniprovemcnt, on Elrh f th, tet. as descrtbed herein 3. 4, NEJ.SWM, NEK,. NSEM. VV ,V Sec. 9, NWMNKM, NYsNWM, SWMNWM. Ny,i provide for the payment of the balance ofRe. T- R. contain5. f2 well, two wind-mni- ; tank, fenc valuc $,W' :" h' fparately. ISF"5SF.M Sec. 31, W'NWK Sec. 33. T. 19S.JA11 of s 6W., sw $ sw,jSVVK S,.,., 10, Sy.SK'i, NW the purchased prices of .aid tracta of laad

t.um Sille No. 5,4, SWMNWM. W'iSWM Sec. The dimmisn'oncr of Public Lands of New K uy Lnt j SW Sec. 4. All,'"!-- ' 11.1J4.99 acres. There are no improve-- !
SK,4 sw SMSM. SW)4SVVH;i equal, annual installment., with

"tr .u. ,l,oe deserllied trads of!2. NE!4, SWtfNWJ Sec. 3, SRH. VyiSFM Mexico, or his agent holding such sale, , Scc c. ) 4, 5. 6. SKNWJ4, EV5 nients on this land. Sr(. j, SENEM. E',SEM. SWSEV4, NW'4 interests on all deferred payment, at tha
. !I? 11 k. l, than Three Sec. 4. N'K See. , N Sec. 10. NWMNWM reserves the richt to reject any and HlsW'4. S' SEW . 6, NF.tfNWtf. NyiNEK,' Sale No. 417. NV.NFtf Sec. 7. T. 22S R. NW Sec. 13. NS4NEM, SEKNF-M- , NEM rate of four per cent per annum, in advance." f,P,;J offered it said sale. Possession under' 80 There no im-- I Sec. 14. NflNWM Sec. 15, All of and interest due on October 1st.Wh is the 11, E',SEM Sec. 17. NK Sec 20. E;hMs sESjNEH Sec. 7, All of Sec. 8. WMNWM", 6V containing acres. are NWH paymentsDollars ($3.00) per Sec. 19, T. 7S R. HE., containing contracts of sale for the above desenned w,?Swu Sec 9 T. 20S R. 12W., W,WV4 provements on this land. Sic. 16, SEKNEH. NSEU, SWM, SWMSEMlof each year, and such other condition.,
"Jt of landa will he 15n0 aeres. There" are no improvementa tracis wiTl he given within thirty daysiS(.c. 14 All of Sees. 15, 16, Ej'iM-.K- , SE; Rale No. 418, All of Sees. 16, 17. N,, SE Sec. 17. SEMNEM Sec 1R. Ni4 NEM, SWM obligations reservations and terma a. may

above aale "i ,hi, an() after date of .ale. 'U,r, SVc 17 NWSWi Se--. 21. T. 9S., Sec. 19. T. 20S., R. 6W., All ol Recs. 6, 7. T. NEM, NW, S See. 21, All of Sec. 22, be required by law.
to the following term.

10 The , Witness my hand and the official seal f r rw 'c, mai,, 53TO75 acre,. The im-- 20R., R 6V. All of Sec, 1. 2. 3, Lot 1 Sec SEijNEM. SWMNWM, WS4SEM. SWMSEM,' ' described herein
Tne .iicce.sful bidder, must pay Sa,e No 515 F t,lSWfi Sec. 13. W, ,h? state land Office this 4th day of August.' " "I 4. Nvl Sec. 10 N'-- Sec. II. NX Sec. 12. Syi Sec. 33. All of Sec. 24, NWMNEM.I' bV ,'P""ItCiy,ieoBiiniaiioner of Public Land., or hi. agent .yM SMSWM Sec. 14. NK. SWM. NF.MSEM n 1011 ir'"Vm ,n. . .'. V. ..... . .1... .," t'u,i t, it tikt.. s 11 wv. See. 22.1 v..?.-- See 25 NuNK. SEUNr-f- The r Land, of New

ot tne price. 10.. y c i u. iz c. n ui. c. u wi m Niz Ml.'t2c.Ri e .iexn.uRORT. P. ERVTEN
offered by them respectively for '( iann,NW c- - 24. T. 7S.. R. 15E.. containing 1569 Commissioner of Public lands. Sale No. 48.!, SiSEM, NEMSF.M Sec, 28. All of Sec,. 3 5 36, T. S R . 7W SWMSWM 28. All of See. 36, T 25N .. . 31E ,TO SWM j .."Vaid aale Possession T under4 per ernt intere.t in advance tor tn,acr,!1 Tnere ,re no improvementa on thia! State of New Mexi.-o.- ,c . 0 tw.. containing 120 acres. . There S. c. 20. S"!SEM. SKMSWM Sec. 30. T. 20S.. Sec. 8, All of Sec. 16, SWMNEM, SWMNWM, contracts of sale for the above deecribedbalance .tsucn purcnase pritcv, ,nc i, ihu. 101j : . ..1 .j first tir.ncaiion ageusi 11 are no improvements on inis tano. nvv., ,""4. . " " " J kiT; i'.ciiJ' tracts will be given on or Oetore uctooer

1916..hIiT.Therein aid each, .Sale No. 516, Lot 4. Sec. 7. NWM. WHNF.M. La Publication October 20, Sale No. 483, S.Sr-- Sec. .W. Sec. JO 1. .;".--
., iv. evr coiiia.MinK i",wJ '" , V JH ',c'4 """W, " 7S, JQIft.

iqwi 11 silru v v. m h li acn the iniprovemeni s on nits lano con- - sr.j's sec. 1H, 1, e, s r.'inw, c;j ROBT. r. EKVIEN.nd all of said amount., must n oepoaiiec y
- j - .. ' A, Uist ..( two bouses, barns and corrals, gas SWM. EM Sc. 19, Nj, SEM, S'.SVvM, NWM Commissioner ol Public Landa, Stat,

ensine and enirine houa- -, tanks, well and, SWM Sec. 20, WM, SEM Sec. 21, All oil of New Mexico,
windmill. Fairbanks scale., and fencing, Sec. 29, E'i, EMSWM. Lot 4 Sec. 30, Lots; First Publication June 16, 1916.

value $7545 00 2, 3, 4, EVjWM, NEM, NSEM, SWMSEM Last Publication Sept. 8, 191

Sale No. 4to, N'SFM Sec. II SWMNWM Sec. 31, WS',NWM. SEM, SEM NEM, E'iSWM
then, ar-- iiihjec. JoH'St.ge tSS

SF.MNEM. W",NEM. hrS'NW4, ISWH-vv- ,

S". See. 33. W!,SWM Sec. 34, T. IDS., R.
I3W Lots I. 2, 3. 4, SWMNWM Rcc. 5, N'S
I.Sec. 6, T. 20S R. UW., SVSWM Scc. 27,

SWMNWM. N'SWM. SKSWK, W",SF.'4.
SEMSEM Sec. 28, NWMNEM. S.NEM.
SEM Sec. 20. N",NEM. SEMNEM Sic. 33,

IW'jNEM, SKXNK'i. NWM. NE5.SWM. W'--

SEM S c. 34, SWM, S',SI-'- Sec. .15. SWM

01 '" " 10 T 1C 1 Itf 111Q7Q .....

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

GRANT COUNTY.

Sec. 12. i sec. 1.1. SViSt-.'S- , r.savv)a, Sec. 32. T 25.N.. K. VK Nf.saSWa Sec. y.i
not execute? a contract within thirty day. I". " w... ......

the There are no improvement, on 'h,s land.
after it has heen mailed to them hy
State Land Office, .aid contract to provide Sale No. 517, All of Sec. 15, Syi Scc. 16,

tor ihe navment of the balance of the par-- 1 S'A Sec. 17, S, Sec. IS, T. 7S R. 1r.., ron- -

NWMSWM. Rec. 14 NEM3KM. SWMNEM Sac si,SM Sec. II. W'JNWM SEMNWM. NWM:
IS SEM Sec. !'. K' !', SWM Sec. 20. ; Se.;. SWM Sec. 14 All f Sec. II, NEM, N'.NWM.I
K1' NEM. SEM. W' W'4 See 29 E'- - SecW. sEMN WM. 'NEMSF.M Sec. 15, All of STAT OF Nnil 1.chased price, of .aid tract, of land in thirty tainin? MW.S? acre. There are no improve-o- f Commi..ioner of Public LandfcJ iS'c',y'uTc.i.',?NWU c!l!

s.MMt.1 annual navmcnti. with interests oaimcntu on this land. 3.

EW MEXICO. COUNTY 0"
SANTA FE,

1. Ixit. 1. Ml" of Sec. 32, R"J Rec. 33. R'? Ree. 34, SM ',. Id. 21. S'.N,, S' Sec. 22, SWM
ntaining c. .is, T. 211s. K. sw containing a acres. s.,i.4, s,sv 14 Sec. .1, yj r.ec. .j. .1.:. i..i nl ,.. ..1.-- . hr.'i.-,- ' cl'i rcun c... All.U ! payments at the rate of fotirl s , No Slg Sr, s,;Nf Sec. 3If Al, nf! S.mta Fe, New Mexico, AuKuat 4. 1916. . Rl.c 2( T R. 14 W.,... ..nniii In sdvanee. nsvmenta , ' t.o, ,ic!iii, c n Voiiee Is herehv criven that nursuant to 3070.27 acrc. There are no improve! nie iniprovi-mr,,,-

, .... r.i-.- , v. .....
;'.-''- ...?i-4-7"- ,. -.- BAD l.ll-,

--i J- -' J?r., or.)csvv.5sioci-- . ,'l
-

','-- '. ': ', . . Tfc. .... ii uiaa,. II t int, and f. nciiiK, value JOS). of Sen. 26, 27, ny N',Sr.V. sr.;'4Sr.,ana interest., sue on ucioper i,wi ,T. 7S.. R. 18E., containing 1411.50 acre.. ' "c provision. .11 n r.. i .,. '.inin.r o. ..... ... - ... . - swMNE'Sec
There "are 'no improvement, on this land. proved June 20, 1910 the laws of the State, he required to

New and the rule, .nd regula. change theof Mexico, total amount offered by him N", Sec. 31 T. 23S.. K. :w., "'" ,"6V?-S?-
WITHIN THE COUNTY OF SANTA FB

IN THE MATTER OF THE LASTRale No. 519. SWMSWM. NMSWM. SMNWM. .7 'I .1. ."L , A,r' .1.. , .1...' , ,e Th. r
tWVi j?. All 01 net. jo, t. 1.,., v.NMSEX Sec. 11, REM" WM, N54NWJ, Sec ,:,.: nf Pm. 1 ,nH, will offer at Puhlic, Sale No. 484. SWM NEM. E'iSWM. WKSEjl this land

12, T. 8S., R. HE., containing 400 acre. SEM .r... All ot sec. 10, mki.4' NEMNEM. SWVJNEH. ';..'""'..?",':,..,,, . ctww tutSale to the highest bidder at 1 o'clock, Sec. 26, t'Vj, E",NWM. SWM Sic. 35, All ot Snle

year, and su.-- other conditions, obligation.,
re.ervationi ind terms as may be required
bt-- law

Each of th- - tracts a. described herein
Will be offered separately.

The Commissioner of Public Lands of Ntw
Mexico, or his agent holding such aa!e,
reserves rh-- i riitht to reject any and all
bids offered at said sale. Possession tnder
c.vatracts ot .i.ile for the above described

There are no improvement .. on ,ur!)(nv. uctooer tn, iiio. 10 sec. jo, 1. r,. v..ui,.....k ,v . viviKl'ti Q..e vivw See 20. i,itsiNF.tSF.U Ser. 11.1,1.. i. n nl l, Ciiv Pooniv ,, tlrant. o r,-- . The iniiirovemenls on this land con- - .. SEMSI '1 Sic. it, w sec. n, 1 . , '.V,;.,,;.,, ' ecu cuji Emit Irhtielder. Deceased.Sale No. 520, S'SNEX,
SWMNWM Sec. 12. T. 9S. , R. ME., contain-- Si.ite of New Mexico, infront of the courtisi.t of home, well, windmill, link, fencing., R. 6W. btJ, S'.NW'f, R'.NEM. NEHSW) J, i,jNWW NWM NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT OF EXECU

TRIX.
.rill, iriven that the nn.'

no Improvement, 1,011 - therein, the following described tract., value $1452.20. Sec l; l.s.. k. mi, coniain'n NW'M.SWM Sec. 34, T. 26N. R. 31E Loll,2,3,
i.-- J .i..' s.t- - No 484. S'SRK See. 29. A I of Scc. The improvements on this land consist of. twuKVU KKifJKU S.c Km.Ve is he

ing 161 acre.. THeTe are
on thi. land.

value M2J. 1: 1 ;, 'i i. '3. 'j.'sWWNEM. S',N WM.SWM. .1. rsiemed has been duly aooointed and haaAll of 1. 12. SEM. Sec. 31, T. 19S. . K. 14W., tilicitllT. I2S., R.tract. w.U oe given Wltnin tnirry oay. ao . Th .'e' . .i '.e .i .7 ',. etuCB-- vi.-- , rlvu'mlwtS SFUSWli F.l.SEU. I.t. Sal No. 42. xecutrix of the above entitled.,.0,4 Ei.jSEM. SWMSEM Sec. 2, S'iS", Sec. 12. qualified as erter dat of S',;SEM. SWMSWM,N'.:S!- - and that all persons having cUimaesi .lieimprovements on this latid. Sec. 20, NEM, NMNWM, SEMNWM Sec 21.il. 4. Sec. 0, All of Sees 7, 10, u, is, .yi, n. n., con,.i,n,t- - - ':" " "' '""J"';; NEMNEM. Sec. 24, T. 24N.. R. 31E.. a(,lin tho ,a e,tate should present tbaSale No. 522, All ol Sec. 32, T. 125., K.W!:SW! Sec. 22, WM, SEM Sec 23, An, N"SWM, swyssw. sec. 11. .mi 01 mints mi ..... .a.e. .

c... VWU WIZMRU KKU .... : ac... m t sis It. UW.. coniuiiiu.K jiii.,, 111 O ,.1I'7S-"- ' i " t'..'rmt same 10 tne iinoersiHiieu wiiiuu . uc
25R..31. T.17E., containing 640 acres. There are no ,,f Sees. 24, 25, EMNEM. WNWM. SEM

improvement, on thi. land. NWM. P'SSEM. SWMSEM, SWM Sec. 26, TI.'. ,ffln,v.,n.,,i,t. on this land con- - pale No. 423. Lot Rer, ,x- . S'. Si C. 1.'. At Ol aec, IJ. 1. scribed by law.
All'silt of fencing, value $400. inW., rontaininf 3".7S acres. The improve-- 1 R. Uts 2, 3, 4, EM.SWM Sec 7,

9Vitnes mv hand and the official seal of
tlie State f. and Office thia 4th day of August,
, D., 1916.

ROBT. P. ERViEN
Commissioner of Public Lauds.

State of New Mexico.
Wr.t Publication August 11, 1916.

Last Publication October 20, 1915.

JOHANNA UHLFELDER.No bid on the above dcscnDel tracs 01 S!4. N'N' Sec. 27. S'5. w1'.!'! W'4. n
land will be accepted for less than Three Sale No 486 S".SWM SWMSEM Sec. 6, im-n- ts on thi. land con.i.t ot a well, vaiwe

AH of 'Sec 7,'NWMNWM, SJ.NWM. SWJ $500.

Sec. 8. All of Sec. 17, 18, T. 21S.. R. HW; Rale No. 424. !t 3 Sec. 31. T. 25S.. R. WW.,

containing 2278.08 acres. There are n im- - containing 3990 acres. The improvement.

NEM. SWMNEM Sec. 28, SM, NEMNEM
Sec. 29, SEM, WMNEM Sec. 30. ES Sec.
31, All of Sec. 32, WMNEM, SEM Sec. 33,
WMNWK. NWMSWM. SVSSWM. REM Sec

Si W,,5!! '8.' First Publication Aug. II. 19U
2. 3. Sec. 20, e- -. iUsl 1 M'"""I ,91- -NMSeS, SW( SEM. N'SWM. SEM
SWM Sec. 29. T. 26N., R. 30E., Lots 3,

Dollars ($3.00) per acre, wnicti ia tne ap-

praised value thereof.
Sale No. 524, All of Sec 36, T. 10S.. R.

19E., containing 640 acrea. Then are no tnts on this land. on tins lanu consist 01 a veu,tion M. All of Sections. 35. 36, T. ITI.Vl-.l-l

improvement, on thi. land. 15Vsr svr sw wme,,w! NOTICE.Mr, hid on the above described tract of 1

land will he accepted for le.a than Ten RWM Sec. 4, S' NEM. NSKM, SEWN WM, NVM-.H- . sr.isr. tc. an ''"' '"-- .' ' V 'NEM. SWMNEM. NWMSEM Sec. 19, T. '

Dollar. (tlO.OO) rer acre, which is the ap SWMRcc. 5, All of Sec 6. WVEM, REM. Sec NW5.. NhMJ-WM-
. V'P' TuV. a' WSw7fe IS T. 2SS., 34N., R. 32E.. containing 36617.47 acre.;

wy, Sec. 7. SJ sec. . ?rVHaS- - T.' V' r' .,0. J,i , 1 ''l o
' . ...:.!.. in Th, imneove. Ihere are no improvement, oo tni. lano. NOTICE IS HERBY GIVEN, That9. SKSEtf. SEMSW51 Sec. 10. tWWH. I..W, All ol sec. jo, i. aia., . "., ""' "": ' rl.,' '

i. swi an Ce K T XN t. s.Sec.
Vfi ,skuu cicwu SKSFtf See 11. VM P1S.43 acres. The improvement, on mints on tnis lanu consul oi wei.. v..u, . .... T i". t m i.l

praised value thereof.
Sale No. 525, All of Sec 35. T. I0S R,

19E., containing 640 acrea. There are no
improvementa on thi. land.

No bid on the above described tract of

e Board of County Commisionersui.is a. s, a, ar.xi""?. 111
NF.'A. NWMNEM. NMNWM. NEMSEM Sec ti n lan.l consist of fencing, valne fSOO.

(. J'lh, , lot. i, i, si'irsr.'. svi aec. i, . ... t f tAll of Sec. I, T. 25S.,R. Sale No. 4?7
13. W4NF.M. NEMNWM Sec. 14, All of Reel Sale No. 4R8, Si c. 18, . s Lois 1, 2, 3. 4. SEM NEM, S,NWM. SWH,itiI Kio rriua bulimy, iv. m. iidsc

atton for op- -land will ne accepten tor less man Sec. Zl, SWitsw sec. ci, nn nw., coniaimng h.- - VWMSFM. SEMSKH sec. Mits I, , i, tnr
Dollar. moOOl oer acre, which ia the ap-- 1 ci'cri? See. 28. WMNWM. REM NWM. SWMnunts on this land consist of fencin,;, value ,.;t.t s on tins land consist of four wells, SEM. E'.SWM. NWM: POStpotlCU Consider

uilding of thepraised value thereof. SfM NSEM See 33, NWMNWM. NWM KEUsT.: sT. FM Rec. 22 T. 26S . R. 9W..'?W Sec. J. KKNEM Sec. ,0 Aid of Sec..;eni 0f bid, for the b

pt. 4th, A. Dnn oi arc c, i,- i. iv. u..., ''" - i,7J 'no. i.,., vvva, S'jsr.va nee. .... ,J.
19E.. containing 642.40 itrn There are no T.oi, 3. 4. FWRWM. SWMSEM Rec 4. WH- SWM Sec 12, T. 20S., R. 13W.. containing

. 320 acres. The improvement, on R N,;i NMSWM c. 24, T. 24N..; Court House until Se
imnrovement. on thi. land. : ttFM. NEMNWW. W'SEM. SEMSEM. s.c 9,. ing 240 acres. There are no improvementa tni. i.in.i ",,.,., R. .jiF... containing s.556.47 acrea. mere are ,..., f ,t, c Board oft.j .l j V I .1 r i..,t.t?.i f . . ,v r m .,. .1... t..l s,.Ie no. 4J"1 v '4 to, o ' ' ... ;,n...v.meni on Ih.s land . , ui.o-- i inno ma on inc iuo,c uhuiucj ..a, . All or nee. lo. r.war.i ., . " ' . ... . , . nM . ""v . ,. . .. . .

I ...111 k. . ihin Ten I'ttr.rc r. eriC.ltl C.. is g1tjyzvtA WU ,le n 4'JO SK'NKW Sec. 15. All Ol SCC containing loo, ai res. , .,c i.i.i .... s . j71 j,(.c 0, . or,.. IS. -- c... con'.-,,,,,,,,-
. I i . . ,nn nre

Dollars (jlO.OO) oer acre, which i. the an- - cir,
' skUsV.isSer. 19. E'NEM. F.VSEM See.! T. 2IS.. R. 14W, containing 680 acrea.-thi- land consist of well, fencing and clear- -

ta,,nK 316.47. acre.. There are no improve- -

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

GRANT COUNTY.

OtfHce of the Commissioner of Public Landa,
Santa Fe. New Mexico, August 4, 191$.

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to
tile provisions of an Act of Congress, Ap-

proved June 20, 1910, the law. of the State
M New Mexico, .nd the rule, and regula-ran- a

of the State Land Office, the
nf Puhlic Lands will offer at Public

Jkle, to the highest bidder at 1 o'clock,
P. M, on Tuesday, October 24th, 1916, in the
town of Silver City, County of Grant, State
if New Mexico, in front of the court houae
therein, the following described tracta of
kind, vis:

Sale No. 503, REM Sec. 18. NEM Sec. 19,
KV4 Sec. 30. NEM Sec. 31. T. 27S R. 21 W..
eaataining 800 acre.. There are no improve-
menta on this land.

Sale No. 504, All of See 8, T. 30S., K.

tnW., containinr 640 acre. The improve-nent- s

on thi. land eonai.t of house, well,
and fencing, value $1200.

Sale No. 505, NWM Rec 7. SWM. NEM

Sc- V, SWM. NEM Sec- - T. 30S.. R.

WW., containing 804.13 acre.. The improve-
ment, in thi. land consist of cabin, five
wells, fencing, and twenty acre, grubbed.

thereof. h 'HWWK Sec 21 SFMSWM Rec. 22, There arc no improvement, on thi. land, mc, value inm. nients on this land.

Pe Bb?w land, wffl be subject NFMtVM ser77, WrWjl, W4SWli Sale No. 491, SFMNE'4, NEMSEM See. Rn-- No. 4 SWM Sec 9. T. 2fS.. MW
.Sa,r j;.. NWM. W'.NEM Sec. 6. T. 26.N..

to the following terras and condition,, via: M SWMNWM. NKRWM. REM Sec. 29, 11. SWMNWM. NWMSWM Sec. 12. T. &. containing 10 acre, " R- E.. S'i Sec 31 T. 27N.. R. K., con
The successful bidder, must pay to the rtvpi Rec 30. S'SEM See. 31. R. liW.. containing 160 acre.. The im- - thi land consist of and clearing, ,.,imllf( ,H7, a;-- There are no improve

Given this 17tb day of August 1915

M. A. GONZALES,
County Clerk.

By M. Garcia, Deputy.commissioner of Public Lands, or m. agent!,.,;, swm Sec. 33, T. 14S., K. mw.. sw provemenis on u..s ,,,n.. ""j- " - "l", , -

holdiag .uch .ale. of the prices VWM RWM. SMREM Rec 4. All nf Sec. S, reservoir and canal, value $.000. yc, N". 431, NEM Ree 9. T.JnS ."'"-- Sale .13. 'J-''- ' ,,s !SWS,!y

J!L2XrZ.fii A SHrJV' wVWSE'Rec"'27n,f .e 4W. Rt, See II. T. . R, 7W.. "'kZ S 26V..

":i i!

Only Giand Prize
co,; cde;tal to the le herein, snd each Sec ii. SWMSEM Sec 24. T. 15S.. R.i20S.. R. UW.. containing 4321.2 acre.. The containing "pw'.n. enrs on ' " "
and all of said amount., must be deposi.ed tsw", containing 20,431.42 acre,. The in.-'- , iniprov.-mi-nt- on thi. land consist of fencing, ,b, land consist of two well. vaHe prosement. n tnts .and

srwlidnU'To eVAttrN., W',NEM. ESNWM Sec.,,, cotA f .JreJ. WWVh m "e subject to forfeiture to the State 's"l No. 45" AM of See. 16. T. MS, R. T. MS.. R. I4W.. con.aining 160 acre The men,, on J, this and
of Ne, Mexico if the .uccessjul bddr. do W., containing 640 acres. There sre no iniprovements on tht. land con,,,, of fencing. Sale Vk 34. NF5 Sec 6 . T R.JW. "".J SE!4SWH.i'.ed Sec ... .j' 404. T. 4. 5. 6. WKSEM Sec 'U. of we,, and "fencing, value See..13. T. 25N. K. WF containin. 44, (Hlliesi Award)
...... ..

;j. . ' . " vs- .- vi.vvvu Wi.NFK NWUSEU Sec. 11. 5. t ' iiven to
! DictionariesX;Tif ThS Ma'of .frpir: r?no"-n:e.ro,,- land T. 18S.. R. 14V., containing 377.28 acre,. Sale No, 435, NEM See '

chased pPricye. of .aid tract, ol lad in thirty SaIc No;.V Sec. 9. RWMRWM J be
value

on this land con,,,, ItW , "''' Jt'jro'lTT.d .afning'V aci "fjre5 !L, 'Improve L2W :'"AJi
equal, annual payment., with interests on s,.r ,. W'NWM Sec. 15. All of Rec IK, T. fencing J50-

all deferred payment, at the rate of four 17S R. invV., containing 840 acres. There Sale No. 49S, EvNWM SWH Sec

per cent per annum, in advance, payment. ar,. n improvements of Section 2" l al (he Panama- -18, All ofi.;w. 17 c... v j f HUr t Sor. 36. All SU AiX . Hal n

"sale NoS- -

506, SV.SW. SWMSEM Sec 9.
SWMNWM Rec. 15. N',SEM. NMSWM Sec

, T. 3IS.. R. 20W., containing 320 acrea.
Tne improvements in thi. land consist ol

l.r.S-.RW- Sec. 4. NMNWM

Sec 9 T. MS.. R. 20W., containing 160 acres.
' . Improvements OH thi. land.

on this land. 28, " . .... ,t,pp, in i 't.. Sec 30, T. 24N., K. 29E., o n'im-. - ... . rt a .. r c .: 41 T D llir - san . T C.. II "1" HI H W . Hi r.". I. : Pacific ExposilionSale No.-46- SWMSEM Sec. 9, All ol sec. ."ui oi ,ii". . - "d . o v. ivv. ,nc '054.6. aires. I here are no imp- - ve-

16. T. 19S. R. 19W.. containing 680 acre,. 3640 acres. I here are no improvement, on s . or. ' ' ' .". " on th
and interest, due on uctouc. s. ' -

year, and such other condition,, obligations,
reservations and terms as may be required was granted toThe improvements on thi, land consist ol th,' ' land.

2 EVi Sec WH NWMSWM Sec' 11. NNFM,' SWMNFM: Sale 379, E'i c 20. SWMNWM. W .SWM
fencing, value $200. .... ...,.: ..'V A" 7 S!T V, "'ii , ViSWli See. 16. T. 20S.. R. 5W.. con Sec. 21, T. 24.N.. K. 3ttE., containing 44t acr,.by lawiqrre . . "VI. .I n I' m . millAll II aeci. a, v, J, v, 7 4WEBSTERS

lHEW IliTERKATiCftAL1
SsS". All o7 S.."M,M. HWIJ be Sieved .epaVa'telV

"
3, NEM REM Sec. 4, T. 16.'. R. I7W, contain-- : :,S.'. R..12W.. containing 2107.56 acre.. There laining acres on Ihere .ere -.-5-- h" nE.

Sec. 34 T. 27S R "W.. Public Lands of New thi, no , on this ,1,,. land cons.s. of fencing, .slue c.n1,in,nKVc 17. WWF.M Tht Commissioner of ,ne .,3,1a, ,rr. The impeovem-n- t, on ar.; iniP Ijjld 160 a.te.. There an no improve- -
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