
State of Maw Manias, if tkitial aantenti to be credited oa th anths date of the contract aad to provide
for tht payment of any unpaid balance at
th expiration of thirty year from the
date of tha contract with Interest on defer-
red psymentt at tht rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract, par-
tial payment! to be credited on tht an-

niversary of the date of tht contract next

of the Stat' Land Office of the But of
New Mexico, th.it 10th dsy of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

Stat of New Mexico.

First Publication July 19, 1918.
Last Publication September 27. 1911.

-

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE POR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

GRANT COUNTY

nice of thi Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fc, New Mexico.

Notice it hereby given that pursuant to
th provision ol an Act oi Congress, ap- -

lone JOth, 1910, the law of the
Koved or New Mexico end the rule and
regulations of the Stat Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Landa will offer
M public le to the highest bidder at
1 o'clock P. M on Friday, October 18, 191.
an the town of Silver City, County of
Grant, State of New Mexico, in front of
the court home therein, the following des-

cribed tracts of land, via.)

9j All of Sections 16, 17; EX, See. 16;
EX. Sec. 19: All of Sections 30, 29; EX.
SWX, Sec 30; All of Sections 31, 32: T.
28 S, R. 3 W.,A1I of Sections 2, 1, 4,
5, 6: NX, SEX, Sec 9: SWX, Sec 14; All
of Sections 15, 16; SEX, Sec. 21; All of
Sections 22, 36; T. 28 S., R. 6 W., conUin.
ing 24,640.43 acres, of which 7,047.69 acres
were selected for the Santa Fe and Grant
County Railroad Bond Fund. The improve-
ments consist of

No bid on the above described trsets will
be accepted for lest thsn THREE DOL-
LARS ($3.00) per acre, which it the ap-

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must nay for the im-

provement t that exist on the land.

SshNs.114- )- WX. SEX. SXNEX. Sec.
36; T. 23 S., R. 9 W containing 560.00

acres. There are no improvements on tin
tract. No bid on the above described
tract of land will be accepted for less than
$10.00 per acre

Each of the above described tracts will
be offered for sale separately.

The above sale ot lend will be subject
to tht following terms and conditions, vis.:

Except for land selected for the Santa
Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund,
the successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public Lands or his agent
holding such sale, of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the bal-

ance of such purchase price, fees for 'ad-
vertising and appraisement and all costs
incidental to the sale herein, each and all
of said amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of sale
and which said amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
alter it has been mailed to him by the

following tne oate ol tenaer.

The above ssle ol land win oe suoiect
to valid exialin richts. easements, rights
of way, and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding auch ssle reserves the right
to reject any and all bids offered at said
sale.

Possession under contract of stle for the
above described trsets will be given on
signing of the contract.

Witness my hsnd and the official seal
of the State Land Office of the State of
New Mexico, this 10th dsy of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.

First Publicstion July 19, 1918.

Last Publication September 27, 1918.

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND .SALE

SANTA FE COUNTY

Office of the Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fe, New Mexico.

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to
the provisions of an Act of Congress, ap- -

SWXSEX, Sec. 35; T. 17 S., K. 11 W.. SWX
Sec. 1; Sec. 4;

SmSeu? S?c 5; WW. NWM14W Sec.

NWM, Sec. 14; T. S, U VV;l contain,
ing 32,413.08 acres, of which 20,547.34 acres
vers selected for the Santa Fe and Grant
Connty Railroad Bond Fund. The improve-
ments consist of wells, tanks and fencing,
value $10,000.00.

No bid on the above described tracts will
be accepted for less than THREE DOL-
LARS ($3.00) per acre, which is the ap-

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay for tha im-

provements that exist on the land.

Salt Na. UM All of Sec. 16; T. 19 S.,
R. 9 W., containing 640.00 acres. The im-

provements consist of fencing, value $408.15.
No bid on the above described tract of land
will be accepted for lest thsn $10.00 per
acre. -

Each of the above described tracts will
be offered lor sale aeparately.

The above sale of land will be subject
to the following terms and conditions, via.:

Except for land selected for the Santa
Pe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund,
the successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public Lsnds or his agent
holding such sale, of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in sdvance for the bal-

ance of such purchase price, feet for ad-

vertising and appraisement and nil costs
incidental to the sale herein, each and ail
of ssid amounts must he deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of sale
and which said amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it has been mailed to him by the
State Land Office, said contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
the date of the contract and to provide
moke payments of not less than

to the expiration of thirty years from

No bid on the above described tracts will
chase price st any time after the sale and
thirtieth of ninety-fiv- per cent of the pur-fo- r

the payment uf any unpaid baiance at
the expiration of thirty years from the
date of the contract with interest on defer-
red payments at the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary o( the date of the contract, par-
tial payments to he credited on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract next
following the date of tender.

The sale of land selected for the Santa
Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund
will he subject to the above terms and
conditions except that the successful bidder
must pay in cash or certified exchange at
the time of sale, of the purchase
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the balance
of such purchase price and will he re-

quired to execute a contract providing for

proved lune aitn, UiU, tne laws oi mc l curry, oiiic oi i.e-- mean.,, in noil.
State of" New Mexico end the rules and of the court bouse therein, the following
regulations of the Slate I.an.l f)(fi-- the described tracts of land, viz.:
Commissioner of Public Lands will offer
at public sale to the highest hidder at Sale No. 1792 - All of Sec. 16, T 7 N.,
10 o'clock A. M., on Monday. September jj. 36 E containing (An.' 1 acres. The im
30th. 1118. in the town of Sarta Conn- -

provements consist of i.ouse. haru. wrll,
ty of Santa Fe, State of Neu Mexico, in cilitii aiion, value $4,.00.front ol the court house therein, the fol- -

described of land, vir.:lowing tracts Sac N KJJ A) i( j.. T ? N

H R. 34 ii., com anting t.lw...j aeri s. The itn -

RSfE?coi,TngSYSrcr.'"' V im-- ' Provements eon,,,, o, nou.e, shed. corn,,..
jTrovcmen.. consist ol fencing, value $100.00.

( 'j,11- ,ank- ,'n"" an'' pl"w,nK'

Sale No. IM - SEXSWX. SXSEX. S.--

- NX NEXSWX. N 'SEX, S. c. l.l T. 14 Sale No. 12S4 All ol Sec. 16, T. 3 N

N., R. 8 E., SXSWX, Sec. 6, NV;4, NX R. 35 E., contain'ng no ncres. The
SWNl-.X- XSEX, ec. 7, T. 14 proven. ents tonist oi 1, .use, corrals, well,

niversafy of the data of th contract next
oiiowing tot oaic oi icaacr.

The above sale of land will be subject
to valid existing ngats, easements, ngnisand reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or hit
to rcicct anv and all bids offered at said
saic

Possession under contract of aale for the
above described tracta will be given on
signing of the contract

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Land Office of tht Stttc of
New Mexico, this 10th dsy of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of rublic Lands

State of New Mexico.
Firtt Publication July 19, 1918.
Last Publication September 27. 1911

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

CURRY COUNTY

Office of the Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fe, New Mexico,

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to
the provisions of an Act of Congress, ap- -

roved June 20th, 1910, the laws of the
.tate ol New Mexico and the rules and
reaulations of the State Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Lsnds will offer
at public sale to the highest bidder at
9 o clock A. M.. on Monday. September
30th, 1918, in the town of Clovis, County

tanks, fencin;' Kfanary .md plowing, value
$4,975.01).

No bid on the above described tracts will
be accepted for h ss than TF" DOL-
LARS ($10.00.1 per acre, which, i tli

value aid in addition ti ereto
the successful bidder must pay for l lie? im
provements that exist on t he land.

Each ol the above escribed tracts will
be for side separately.

The above safs of land will lie subject
to the following terms and conditions, it.:

The successful bidder must p:iy to the
Commissioner 01 futilrc Lands or ins aitint
holdinsr such sale. one. twentieth of the
rrtce offered by him for the land, lour
per cent interest in advance for the

such purchase price, fees for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all costs
incidtntal to the sale herein, each and all
of said amounts must he deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time oi sale
and which said amounts and all of them
.,r. ..hi,.., fnrfilore to the Cnl nf
Nrw Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it has been mailed to him hy the
State Land Office, said contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
make payments of not less than

of ninety-fiv- per cent oi the pur-
chase price at any time after the sale and
prior to the expiration of thirty years from
the date of the contract and to provide
for the payment of any unpaid balance at
the expiration of thirty years from the
date of the contract with interest on defer-
red payments at the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract, par-
tial payments to be credited on the an-

niversary of the date of the conuact next
folltwing the date of tender.

The above sale of land will he subiect
to valid existing righta. easemecs, riiits-of-wa-

and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding such salr reserves the right
to reject any and all bids offered at laid
sale.

Possession under contrsct of tale for the
above described tracta will be given on
signing of the contract.

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Land Office of the State ol
New Mexico, this 10th day of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.
First Publication July 19, 1918.
Last Publication September 27, 1918.

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

BE BACA COUNTY

Office of Commissioner ol Public
Lands,

Ssnta Fe? New Mexico.

Notii e is hereby giv n that pursuant to
the provisions of an Act of Congress ap
proved June 20th, l"iU, the laws of the
State of New Mexico, and rules and regu-
lations of the State Land Office, the Com-

missioner of Public L.tmts will offer
at public sale, to the highest bidder, al
9 o'clock A. M., on 1 uesday, November
12th, 1918, in the town of Fort Sumner,
County of Pe Baca, State of New Mexico,
in front of the court house therein, the
following described tracts of land, viz.:

Sale No. 1Z5 All nf Sections 1, 2, 3,

4; Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, SW(. NEtfSKtf. Sec.
5: Lota 1. 2. Sec. 6: T. 4 N.. R. 19 E..
Lots 1, 2, 3, 4. SEtfSWtf, SVSSKtf. NEi4
SHJ4, Sec. 1; t.ots 1, 2, 3, SV, Sec. 2;
Lots I, 2, 4, Sfc4. fcec. s. i.ots i, m.j

lsw,, SEtf, Stc. 4: NEtfSVVX, SKSVV'4.
swpSFy Sfr. 5. Lo,, 1 2, 3, 4, Stf,
s "6 N,x Sec. j; S'A. Sec. 8j All of
Sec. 9; F.V5, WANY'A, Sec. 10; All of
Sections 11, 12, 13; N!4NKK, swNf-M- .

W'i, SEW, Sec. 14; K'A. Sec. 15; All ol
Sec. 16; SVVJ4, Sec. 24; V Sec. 25; All
of Sec. a,; EX, Sec. 27; T. 4 N R. 20 E
NHSJ4, Lott 1, 2. 3. 4, Sec. 2; S!4 Sec.
3; S'4, Sec. 4; S4, Sec. 5; NKiSKtf, SEX
SEX. Lot 6, Sec. 6; NEXNE'i, S& Sec.
7: NS4, Sec. S; SV4NJ4, S'A, Sec. 9; SEX
NWX, SWXNEX, Sec. 10; NEX. E',NWX.
Sec. 11; N'4, Sec. 12; All of Sections It.,
17, NJ4NWX. SEXNWX, Sec. 20; NEXNEX,
Sec. 19; T. 4 N R. 21 E., Lot 5. EtfSWX,
NJ4SEX. Sec. 6; EV5NEX. SWXNEX. NWX.
Sec. 7; T. 4 N., R. 22 E., All of Sections
16. 19, NWXNEX, NWX. NWXSWX, Ey,
SEX, Sec. 20; All of Sec. 21; WX, Sec.
22; W" Sec 27; All of Sec. 28: EWA.
WJ4NWX, Sec. 29; W)4, NEX. WSF.X, S. .:.
.10; WXNEX, NWX. NXSWX. NWXSC!,.
Sec. 31; All of Sections 32, 33, WNWtf.
SEXNWX, EXSWX. SEX, Sec. 35; All of
Sec? 36; f. 5 N., R. 19 E Lot 3. NEX.
EVSNWX, NEXSWX. NXSEX. Sec. 31; All
of Sec. 32; NX, NXSWX, Sec. 33; All of
Sec. 36: T. 5 N., R. 20 E., EX, EJ4NWX.
SWX, Sec 31; All ol Sections 32, 33. 34,
35, 36; T. S N., R. 21 E., containing 28,33n.')2
acrea. The improvements consist of fenc-

ing and corrals, valne S8.700.00.

Sale No. UM All of Sec. 15; T. 2 N.,
R. 27 E., containing 640.00 acres. There
are no improvements on this tract.

Sale No. U7 All of Sec. 22; T. 2 N.,
R. 27 E., containing 640.00 acres. There are
no improvements on this trsct.

No bid on the above described tracts of
I All U WIM we an.cjixj iui itn nitnu a n

E2.V!5S ZlJtCW j?'the.ctn tne successful Diooer must pav
fr.r the improvements that exist on the
land.

Sale No. UM All of Sec 36; T. S

N R. 18 E., containing 640.00 acrea. The
improvements consist of fencing, value $350.-0-

No bid on the above described tract
of land will be accepted for leaa than $3.00
per acre.

Each of the above described tracts will
be offered for sale aeparately.

The above aale of land will he subject
to the following terras end conditions,
via:

The successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public Landa or hit agent
holding such sale, ol the
price offered hy him lor the land, four
per cent interest in ndvance for the bal-
ance of such nprchaae price, fee for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all costs
incidental to the sale herein, each and
all of aaid amount mutt be deposited in
caah or certified exchange nt the time
of aale ana which aaid aeaoant and an
of th. ate subject tt foeMtar in th

bidder doss not scent a contract srataan
thirty day afttf it ha boea mailed M
him by th But Land Offiet, Hid asm-tra-

it) proride that th purchaser may
at hi option man payments of not lea
than of ninety-fiv- e par ttsiof tht purchase price at any tma sitae
tht sale and prior to tha expiration of
thirty years from th oat ot th cow-tra-

and to provide for tht payment of
any unpaid balance at th sVtrtisa X
thirty year from th date of the con-
tract with interact on deferred paj ants
at the rat of four per cent per annnm
psysbl in advance on th 4suvcrnr of
the dat of th contract, partial paymentto be credited oa the anniversary of the
dat of the contract next followma th
data of tender.

The above aale of land will he subject
to valid cxiatinsT rights, easements, riehta
of way aa drceervation.

Tht Commissioner of Public Lend or
his exeat holdinsr such aale rcaervca the
right to reject any and ail bid offered
at ssid talc

Potsession- under contracta of aale for
the above described tracta will be arfvan
on or before October 1st, 1919.

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Land Office of the State of
New Mexico, this twentieth day of July,

ROBERT P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands of the

State of New Mexico.
First Publication July 26, 1918.
Last Publication October 4, 1918. f

- .

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE PC PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

MCKINLEY COUNTY

itliee of the Comra tuonrr of Putdic
LdUu ,

Santa Fe, N w Mexico.

V ice is hereby given it:.,- - pursuant to
In. provisions of an A t of Congress ap-
proved June 20th. 1910, tin laws of the
Stale of New Mexico, : nd and regu-
lations ol the State La ni ce, the Co

of Public Luml vill olier at
public salr t" 'he high. bidder st

o'clock A. ii., on Tuesday, Novem' er
"

li, I'JIH, in the town of (ialluii, Cou: ty
. iKiey. St;, lc of V dexico, ;a
rnt of i lie cuur; hoce lii-- n, the fl-,.- .

me; dt Ncrilud tracts of lanu, viz.;

Sale No. 1298 All of Scr'u.j 36, T. 13

N., K. 16 W-- , coin lininn acres. Th re
are no impiu.cu..its on tiu tract. Th-r-

re 3,217,500 ft., II. M. of timber on tilts
i.t, valued at $4,826.25.

The successful bidder will l,e required
to pay in cash or certified xchanue at
the time of sale, the total ..mount bid
tor the land, and he will also be required
to pay for ilie timber at tin above sta'ed
calue.

Sale No. 13M All of Sec. 36. T. 13 N.,
K. 15 W., containing 64iJ.00 acres. The itn- -

frovi ments consisi of house, si eds, barns.
t .iltics. well, pumping plant, clear- -

ink', plowing, cellar, ho bouse, and gran-
ary, .alue $3,3a.'5.00.

No bid on the above described tracts of
land will be accepted for less tl an THKI'.E
IxiI.I.ARS ((3.UG) per acre, which is ihe
appraised value thereof and in addition
thereto the successful bidder must pay tor
the improvements that exist on the land.

Each of the above described tracta of
land will be ottered ior sale aepara
iy.

The anle of land in sale No. 1300 wiM
be subject to the following ttnui and Con-
dition!, vie:

The successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public lands, or his ageat
holding such sale, one- - twentieth of the
price offered by him for t)a land, four

pr cent interest in advance for the bal-
ance of such purchase price, the free
far advertising and appraisement and
all costs incidental to the sale herein, aad
each and all of said amoum s must be
deposited in cash or certified exchange
at the iimc of sale, and which amounts
sand all of them are subject 10 forfeiture
to the State of New Mexico if tha suc-
cessful bidder does not ext cute a con-
tract within thirty days after it haa been
Trailed to him by the State Land Offioc,
said contract to provide that the purchaser
may at his option make paymenta of not

ss than of ninety-fiv- e par
rent of the purchase price at any time al ar
the sale iiiii prior to the expiration at
thirty years Irom date of the contract aad
to provide for the paynfent of any d

balance at the expiration of thirty
years from the dte of the contract, with
interest on deferred payments it the rata
of four per cent per annum payable hi
advance on the anniversary of tha data
of contract, partial payments to be credit-
ed oa the anniversary of the data of
em tract next following the date of tend- -

The above sale of land w'il be aubict
ti valid existing rights, easements, righta
of way, and reservations.

The Cumm i rtsioner of Public Lands or
his agent holding such sale reserves the
right to reject any and all bids offered
at said aale.

Possession under contracts of sale for
the above describid tracts will be given
in or before October 1st, 1919.

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Lani Office of the State of
New Mexico, this twentieth day of July,
1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands,

State of New Mexico.
First Publication July 26, 1918.
Last Publication October 4, 1918.

CLASSIFIED
PERSONAL

EGYITIAN LOVE an. Hypnotic Perfume
(or ladies and gentk men; said to give
power to attract or repel love or make
others do your will. Put it on your tic
or waist and watch results. Package 25c;
3, 60c. 5, $1.00. Chemical Co., Box 69,

Beaumont, Texas. No.

ARE YOU SINGLE? Would you mar-

ry if suited ? Let me find your ideal,
absolute satisfaction ; Many wealthy
wishing marriage; honorable con-

fidential; members deacriptions free;
Mrs. Cappel. Box-75- 7 Oakland Calif.
-- So. Hi

4
NEW FA1RMOUNT MATERNITY HOS-

PITAL for confinement; prices reasonable,
may work for board; babiea adopted. Write
for booklet, Mrs. T. B. Long, 4911 E. 27th.
Kansas City, Mo. No. 203.

DRUG AND LIQUOR HABITS treated by
the most humane and scientific methods
at Magdalene Hospital, Magdalena, N. M.,
Address all communications to Dr. H. J.
Abcrnatby, P. O. Box I03.-- No.

-
MARRY IF LONELY; for results try me;
best and most successful "Home Maker";
hundreds rich wish marriage soon; strict-
ly confidential; most reliable; yeara of ex-

perience; descriptions free. "The Succees-fu- l
Hub", Mrs. Purdie, Box S56, Oakland,

Cal.-N- o.

WANTED TO HEAR FROM OWNER OP
t tt,H fne .ale. O. K.

Hawley, Baldwin, Wis.No.

REFINED SOUTHERN WIDOW, 35, worth
SJ0,a. Would marry. 35, League,
Toledo, Ohio. No.

YOUR FUTURE FORETOLD: Send dime,
age, birthdate for truthful, reliable, con-

vincing trial reading. Harel Hause. 612 St.
Pual Ave. Los Angeles, Cal.-- No.

HANDSOME FRENCH LADY, 21, worth
$125,000. Anxious to marry honorable gentle-
man. Mrs. Warn. 221654 Terapfe St. Los
Angeles. CaL No.

WEALTHY YOUNG WIDOW would marry
trustworthy, home-lovin- man, old as W
considered. Mrs. M. Box $84, Los Angeles,
Cal.-- No.

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES.

FORDS cJW'BURN HALF COAL OIL, or
Chespest Gasoline, nsinf oud 191S Carbure-
tor: 34 miles per gallon guaranteed. Easy
starting. Great .power increase. Attach it ,

yourself. Big profit selling for us. 30 daya
trial Money back Guarantee. Stylea ta
fit any automobile. Carburetor
Comnanv. 180 Madison Street. Dayton. Obi.

No. , .

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

'NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

TORRANCE COUNTY

Office of the Commissioner of Public
Lsnds,

Santa Fe, New Mexico.

Notice ia hereby given that pursusnt to
the provisions of an Act of Congress, ap-

proved June 20th, 1910, the laws of the
State of New Mexico and the rules and
regulations of the State Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Lsnds will offer
at public sale to the highest bidder at
9 o'clock A. M., on Wednesday, October
23rd, 1918, in the town of Estancia, County
of Torrance, State of New Mexico, in front
of the court house therein, the following
described tracts of land, vis.:

Sale No. 127. - SXNEX. SWXSWX EX
SWX. SKX, Sec. 9: All ol Sec. 16; EX
NEX, SWXNEX, SEX, Sec. 17; EX, Sec.
20; All of Sections 21, 28; EX, Sec. 29;
SWX. Sec. 30; NX. Sec. 31; NX. EXSWX,
NWXSWX. SEX, Sec. 33; T. 5 N., R. 11

E., containing 4278.05 acres. The improve-
ments consist of well, windmill, tank, cor-

rals, and fencing, value $3000.00.

Sale No. 127 - SX. Sec. 35; T. 5 N , R.
13 E., containing 320.00 acres. There are
no improvements on this tract.

Sale No. 1277 - SEXSWX. SEX. Sec.
34: SWX. Sec. 35; T. 9 N., R. 7 E., con-

taining 3AO.00 acn fc. The improvements
consist of house, barn, and fencing, value
$585.00.

Sals No. 1271 - EX. EXWX, SWXSWX.
Sec. I; NX. NXSWX. SWXSWX. SxSKX

c. 2; T. 5 N., R. 14 E., All of Sections
35 , 36 T. 6 N., R. 14 E , cotaimng 2336.60
acres. The improvements consist of fenc-

ing, value $100.00.

No bid on the above described tracts will
be for less than THREE DOL
LAR'S (iJOO) per acre, which is the ap-

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay ior the im
provements that exist on the laud.

Sale No. 1278 A. All of Sec. 16; T. 5

N., K. 14 E., containing 640.00 acres. The,
iniiT'.venicnts consist of fencing, value
$400.00. No bid on the above described
tract of land will he accptcd for less than
$10.00 per acre.

Sale No. 127 - NX, SEX, NXSWX. SEX
SWX. Sec. 32; T. 3 N., R. 14 E., contain-
ing oUO.UO acres. There are no improve-
ments on this tract. No bid on the
described tract of land will be accepted
for less than $10.00 per acre. j

Each of the above described tracts will
he offered for sale separately.

The abovo sale of land will be subject
to the following terms and conditions, viz.:

The successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public Lands or his agent
holding such sale,' of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the bal-
ance of such purchase price, fees for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all cosia
incidental to the sale herein, each and all
of said amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of sale
;ind which said amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it has been mailed to him by the
State Land Office, said contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
make payments of not less than

ol ninety-fiv- per cent of the pur-
chase price at any time after the sale and
prior to the expiration of thirty years from
the date of the contract and to provide
for the navment of aav unnaid balance at
the expiration of thirty years from tht i

date of the contract with inurest on defer-
red payments at the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary oi the date of the contract, par- -

tial payments to be credited un the an- -

niversary of the date of the contract next
following the date of tender.

The above sale of land will be subject '

to valid existing rights, easements, rights-of-ws-

and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding such sale reserves the riicht-t-

reject any and all bids offered at said
sale.

Possession under contrsct of ssle for the
above described tracts will be given on
signing of the contract.

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Land Office of the State of
New Mexico, this 10th day of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.
First Publication July 19, 1918.

Last Publication September 27, 1918.

-- -

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION
'

SALE OF PUBLIC LANDS AND TIMBER

OTERO COUNTY

Offtre of the Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fe, New Mexico.

Notice is hereby giv, n that pursuant to
the provisions of sn Act of CnnRress, ap- -

proved June 20th. 1910. the laws of the
Stnte of New Mexico and the rules and
reflations of the State Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Lands will offer
at public sale to the highest bidder at
2 o'clock, P. M on Tu. .day. October Znd,
!'', in tne lown OI iwni'JVimu, cimnij
of Otero, State of New Mexico in front
of the court house therein, the following,
described tracts, viz.:

Sale No. 1287 - SEXSWX. See. 13; SWX
NEW. SEXNWX, SWX. WXSEX. Sec. 14;:
NXNEX, NWX. SEXSWX, NEXSEX. SX
SEX. Sec. 15; All of Sec. 16; WXNEX,
WX, SKX. See. 22; EX, EXNWX. SWX.
Sec. 23; All of Sections 24. 25, 26. 27: NEX
NEX. Sec. 32; All of Sections 34, 35, 36:
T. 16 S., R. 13 E NX, NXSEX. Sec. 1;,
NX. Sec. 2; Lots 1, 2. SEXNEX, Sec. 3;
T. 17 S R. 13 E., containing 78S0.92 acres.
The improvements consist of house, goat
sheds, corrals snd fencing, value, $750.00.

There are 8,755,000 ft., B. M. of timber
on these lsnds valued at 813.132.50.

No bid on the above described tract will
be accepted for leas than THREE DOL-
LARS f$3.00) per acre, which is the ap-

praised value thereof, and ia addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay for the im-

provements that exist on the lsnd.

The successful bidder will be required
to pay for the timber vslued tt $13,132.50

at follows: One-fift- h of the tottl amount
and interest on the remaining s

at the rate of four per cent per annum,
making a total of $3,046.74 to he paid in
cash or certified exchsnge at the time of
sale. The remaining s to be paid j

in four equal annual installments with in-- 1

terest at the rate of four per cent jierl
annum, payments and interest due on the
anniversary 01 tne oate 01 tne contract.

The purchaser will not be permitted to
rut any timber until all has been paid
for.

Sale No. 1287 A All of Sections 31. 32,
.13. 34, 35, 36; T. 24 S , R. 8 E., All of
Sections L, 2, 3, 4, 5. 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11.
12, 13. 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19. 20, 21. 22 23.
24, 25. 26, 27, 28, 29, 30 NEX, NEXNWX,
Sec. 31; All of Sections 32. 36: T. 25 S..

NKNV5, Sec 9; SNJ4. EWSE5. Src. 25;
S'tSrM, Src. 26; All of (frac. I Sec. ;
T. 26 5., R. 6 E., contain. tiff 36,153.24 acres,
of which 160.00 acres were selected for

Fe and Grant County Railroad Brmd
Fund. The improvements consist of well,
tanks and fencing, value $10,000.00.

The above aale of land wit! be subject
to the follow in ff terms and conditions, vis.:

The success fat bidder must nav to the
Commissioner of Public Lands or nit apent
holding snch sale, of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the bal-

ance of snch purchase price, feet for ad-

vertising and appraisement and ell cots
incidental to the sale herein, each and all
of said amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of aale
and which aaid amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the awccessful bidder- does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it has been mailed to him by the
State Land Office, paid contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
make payments of not leas than

of ninety-fiv- e per cent of the pur-
chase price at any time after the aale and
prior ta the expiration of thirty yeara from

. uuu urizvwu V! M P.4an W R.lam. MC.
ifl T. 18 S', ft 11 W., containing 880.00

acres, of which 6X.0O acres were selected
tor the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail--a-

Bond Fund. The improvements con-gi-

of fencing, value $300.00.

Salt No. 181 - SWXSWX. Sec. 17; SWX
SEJa. Sec. 18; WXNWX, NWXSWX. Sec
20; T. 17 S K. 13 W., containing 200.00

acres, of which 160.00 acres were selected
for the ante Fe and Grant County Rail-

road Bond Fund. There are no improve-
ments on this tract.

Sale No. 182 - EXNEX. EXNWX. Sec.
M T. 17 S.. R. 14 W., containing 160.00

acres, selected for the Santa Fe and Grant
County Railroad Bond Fund. The im-

provements consist of fencing,t value $75.00.

Sale No. US3 - Ntf, Sec. 33; SWXNWX,
See. 34; T. 17 S., R. 11 W., containing
366.00 acres. There are no improvements
on this tract.

Sale No. 1ZS4 - EXSEX, 17; SEX
NIC. Sec. 20; NEXNEX, SJ4NX. NWX
SWX. NXSEX, Sec. 21; T. 17 S., R. 13 W.,
containing 440.00 acres, selected for the
Santa Fe anil Grant County Railroad Bond
Pnnd. The improvements consist of house
and fencing, value $150.00.

Sale No. IBS - SX, Sec. J; SEX-
Sec. 4; Lot 1, NKXSKX. Sec. 5;

T. 18 S., R. 11 W., containing 6OT.78 acres.
There are no improvements on this tract.

Sale No. 12SI - SEXSF-X- , Sl.c, 6. SE
NEX. Sec. 7;- - T. 18 S., R. 13 W., contain-in-

80 00 acres selected for the Santa Fe
and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund.
There are no improvements on this tract.

Sale No. 1257 - SXSWX. Sec. 6; NWX,
NXSWX. Sec. 7; SWX, Sec. 18; T. 19 S.,
It 13 W., EXSEX, Sec. 12; T. 19 S., R.
14 W containing 614.44 acres of which
SsH.44 acres were selected for the Santa
Pe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund.
The improvements consist of fencing, value
$225.00.

Sole No. 12S8 - NWX. Sec. 30; T. 19 S.,
14 W, containing 163.53, seres selected

Mr the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-ran-

Bond Fund. There are no improve-
ments on this tract.

Sale No. USt - WX. Sec. 20; T. 19 S.,
R. 14 W., containing 320.00 acres selected
for the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-rea-

Bond Fund. There are no improve-ssrent- s

on this tract.

Sala No. 12M - EX. E'AWA. SWXSWX.
Sec. 35; T. 19 S R. 17 W., containing
5H.00 acres selected for the Santa Fe and
Grant County Railroad Bond Sund. There
nee no improvements on this tract.

Sale No. 12M Lots 2, 3, 4, EXEX, Sec.
1; All of Sections 2, 3. NXNWX. SWX
WWX, NXSX, Sec. W; NXSJ4 Sec. 11; WX
NEK, NWSWX, NWXSEX, Sec. 12; T. 20

S., R. 17 W., containing 2202.72 acres, of
Which 1562.24 acres were selected for the
Santa Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond
Pwnd. The 'improvements consist of house.

Us, well, tencing, value .

Sale No. 122 -- All of Sec. 5; T. 23 S.,
E, 14 W., containing 640.97 acres selected
tar the Santa Fe and Grant County

Bond Fund. There are no improve-atent- s

on this tract.

Sals No. 12(9 - SWKSWji, Sec. 20; SWX
i, WXSWX, Sec. 21; T. 19 S., It 10

W containing 160.00 acres. There are no
improvements on this tract.

Sala No. 124 - SEXNWX. Sec. 1; SEX

KB, EXSEX, Sec. 2; NEXNEX, NWX
SKji, Sec II; T. 19 S.. R. 12 W., EXE&
SeeYl; T. 19 S., R. 13 W., containing 400.50

acres, of which 120.00 acrea were selected
Mr the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-
road Bond Fund. There are no improve-
ment on this tract.

Sale No. !M - Lot 1, SXNWX. SWX.
SSEX, Sec. 31; T. 20 S., R. 14 W.. SEX.
Sec 35; T. 20 S., R. 15 W containing 522.40

acres, of which 160.00 acres were selected
tar the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-
road Bond Fund. The improvements con-sa-

of fencing, value $110.00.

Sala No. UN Lot 2, Sec. 5; All of Sec.
; NJNEX, RWKNEX, WX, SEX, Sec.

X; T. 24 &, R. 17 W., containing 1281.95
aoaes. There are no improvements on this

Sato No. 127 - NEX. SXNWX, NXSWX.
See. 4; T. 33 S., R. 17 W., containing 330.72

There are no improvements on tnis

Sala No. IMS All of Sections 34. 35;!
T. S., R. 17 W., All of Sections 17, 18, J

ML 20; T. 27 S., R. 16 W.. All of Sections
3, 4, 5, , T. 26 S., R. 17 W., containing!
99.38 acres selected for the Santa Fe and

Grant County Railroad Bon-- Fund. There
ft no improvements on this tract. I

fUle No. I2M - WXSEX. EXSWX. Sec.'
$; NKXNKX. WXEX. tKNWK, SWX.
See. 8: ESr.M- SEXNEX, Sec. 7; SWX
SE'4, Sic. 1?; NV5FM, N.SSEVtj, Sec. 13;'
.mi ol .v 17: t;.;.-f.:'- sft!cyt. nec.
30; SK. Sec. 18; Lot 1, Sec. 19; EtfW
SEW, Sec. 31; All of Sec. 32; T. 18 S.. R.
U W., EX, S!4SWtf, Sec. 15; NEXNF-H-,
Sec. 22; NVNVVX. Sec. 23; SW'XWX, SE!4,
Sec. 24; NEX, NEXSEX, Sec. 25; T. 1R S..
R. 14 YY., containing 3dw.'7 cr.a, ot ,t!:i.-i- t

afAOO acres were selected (or the Santa Fe
aad Grant County Railroad Bond Fund.
The improvements consist of fencing, value
isrs.tn.

Sala No. tnt - E'SNEX. NEXSEX, SWX-SEX- ,

Sec. 11; WS4NWX, SWX. Sec. 12; EK
NWX, NWXNWX, Sec. 13; WXNEX, Sec.
14; T. 18 S.. R. 14 W., containing 600.00
ores selected for the Santa Fe and Grant

Coanty Railroad Bond Fund. The improve-
ments consist of fencing, value $150.00.

Saw No. 1271 NEXSEX. Sec. 14; NX
SWX, Sec. 13; T. 18 S R. 14 W., contain-la-

120.00 acrea selected for the Santa Fe
aad Grant County Railroad Bond Fund.
Taerc are mo improvements on this trsct.

Salt Na. 1271 - NEXNWX, Sec 26; T.
M S., R. 14 W., containing 40.00 acrea. The
improvements consist of fencing, value
$23..

Sale Na. tm - SWXNEX, SEXNWX,
WWSEX. Sec 35; T. 18 S.. R. 14 W SWX
NEX, NWX, NtfSWX. SEXSWX. SEX,
Sec 1; All of Section 3; NEX, W14SEX.
Sec 12; T. 19 S., R. 14 W., containing
1563.18 acres, of which 1402.18 acres were
elected tor the Ssnta Fe and Grant Coun-

ty Railroad Bond 'Fund. The improve-
ments consist of 3 houses, slaughter house,
ant houses, 2 wells, windmill, gas engines,,
tracing tanks, value $7,362.50.

Sab No. 1271 A Al of Sec. 2: SEX,
Sec. 3; NHNWX, SEXNEX, SXSWX, SV4
SEX, NEXSEX, Sec. 4; All of Sections 10,
ll;Tots 3, 6, 7, SWXNEX, Wtf. W4SEX
Sec 13; All of Sections 14. 16, NJ4NM5,
SWX. SWXSEX. Sec. 17; SEX, Sec 18;
SWXNEX, SV4NWX, SWX. c.

20; All of Sec. 23; Lots 2, 3, WXNEX.
WX, Sec. 24; Lot 6, NWX. NKSWX. SWX
SWX. NWXSEX. Sec. 25: All of Section
2: (.. F.MW54, Sec. 27: SSNEX. FV5 NWX-
NWX NWX. NHSEX. Sec. 28; ESEX. Sec.
33; Afl of Sections 34, 35, 36; T. 33 S.. R.
14 W.. EV4. NWX. NEXSWX. SVSSWX, Sec
S; NEK. SXNWX, NWXSWX. SXSX. Sec.

; Lot 3, SWXNWX, WWSWX- - Sec. 4:
NWXSEX. SWXSWX. Sec. 5: WX. NFX
NEX, SHNEX. SEX. Sec. 7; NEXSWX. SX
SWX, NXSEX. SWXSEX. Sec. 8; All of
Sec. M; SEXNEX. NEXSWX. SXSWX. NX
SEX. Sec 17; NXNEX. SEXNEX. NWX.
NXSWX. SEXSWX. WXSEX. SEX SEX,
Sec 18; NX. Lots 3, 4 Sec. 19; WXNWX.
EXSWX, Sec 20; WXNWX. SWXSWX
Sec 2; SEXNWX, NEXSWX, SWXSWX.
Set 27; NWXNWX. NWXSWX- - SEXSWX.
SWXSEM. Sec 29; SXNEX, NWX. NEX
SEX, Sec 30; NEXSEX. See. 31; AH o Se.
31: All of Sec 32; WXNEX. SEXNWX.
SWVL Sec 34; All of Sec. 36; T. 33 Si. R.
If W-- SXSX. See. I; All of Sec 36; T.
33 S, R. 15 W, SXSX. Sec I; All of Sec.
12; EX. Sec 1.1; All of Sections 25. 36. T.
31 S.. R. .M W.. All of Sections I, 2. 3.

SX, Sec ; SX, Sec 5: SX, Sec 6; All of
Sections 1, 8. 9, W. 11, 12, U, 14. 15. 16.
V. 18; Afl of (frac) Sec 19; All of Sec-
tions 20. 21. 22. 23. 24; T. 34 S, R. 14 W.,
EHNWX. NEXSWX. SEX. Sec 3; SWXSEX.
Sec II: SEXSWX. SWXSEX. Sec. 12; NWX
SEX. NXSWX. sec U; NWXNEX. NEX

State Land Office, said contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
make payments of not less than one- -

tliinieth of ninety-fiv- ocr cent of the pnr- -

chase price at any time after the sale snd
prior to the expiration of thirty years from
the date of the contract and to provide
for the payment of any unpaid balance at
the expiration of thirty years from the
Hate of the contract with interest on defer
red payments st the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract, par-
tial to be credited on the an
niversary of the date of the contract ni xt
following the date ol tender.

The sale of land selected for the S:ina
Fe an I Grant County Railroad Bond Fund
will be subject to the above terms and
conditions except that the successful bidder
must pay in cash or certified exchanire at
the time of sale, of the puri'hasi-pric-

offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the balance
of such purchase price and will be r- --

quired to execute a contract proviuinif lur
the payment of the balance of such e

price in thirty eqtfal annual instal-
ments with interest on all deferred pay-
ments at the rate of four per cent per
annum in advance, payments and interest
due on October first, of each year.

The above sale of land will be subject
to valid existing rights, casements, ,

and reservations.
The Commissioner of Public Land, or his

to rcicct any and all bids offered at said
sale.

Possession under contract ot sale lor tne
above described tracts will be given on

Witness my hand and the officlM seal
of the State Land Office of the State of
New Mexico, this 10th day ol July, Wis.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.

First Publication July 19, 1918.

Last Publication September 27, 1918.

-- -
STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

SIERRA COUNTY

Office of the Commissioner of Public
k""1' Sants Fe, New Mexico.

Notice ia hereby given thst pursuant to
the provisions of an Act of Congress, ap-

proved June 20th, 1910, the laws of the
State of New Mexico and the rules and
regulations of the State Land Olfice, the
Commissioner of Public Landa will offer
at sublic sale to the highest bidder . at
3 o'clock P .M., on Wednesday, October
16th. 1918, in the town of Hillsboro, bounty
of Sierra, State of New Mexico, in front
of the court house therein the following
described tracts of land, vis.:

Sab No. 1226 - SEXNWX, Sec. 14; T.
13 S., R. 6 W., containing 40.00 acres. The
improvements consist of ditch and fencing,
value $50.00.

Salt Na. 1227 - Lot 5, SEXSWX, SX
SEX, Sec. 6; EX, Sec 8; All of Sec.

9:4, Sec.' 10; SEX. SXSWX, Sec. 14;

SWXNWX, SWX, WXSEX. SfeXSEX, Sec.
15; All of Section 16; NX, SEX. Sec. 21;
NXNEX. NXNWX. SWXNWX, Sec. 22; T.
14 S., R. 2 W., containing 3320.34 acres,
of which 480.00 acret were selected for the
Santa Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond
Fund. The improvements consist oi s
house, value $300.00.

Salt No. 1228 - Lots 1. 2, 3. SNWX.
cuu Si.SFi. See. 6: All of Sections 5.

4, T. 15 S., R. 1 W., containing 1740.57 acres.
.,The improvements consist oi wc

fencing, value $350.00.

Sale No. 1221 SX, Sec. 8: WX Sec.
15: All of Sections 16, 17, 21; NX,
Sec. 22; SWXNWX. WXSWX. Sec. 21; NX
NX. Sec. 25; SWXSWX, SXSEX, Sec 1;
SEXNEX. EXSEX. Sec. 12; EXNEX. Sec.
13; T. IV S., R. 5 W containing 3640.00 acres
of which 2f 00.00 acres were selected ior the
Santa Fe and Grant County Railroad Mind
Fund. The improvements consist of 2

wells and windmills, tanks ami fencing,
value $2,100.00.

G.I. m. in SWviSWX. Sec. 17. T.
19 S., R. 7 W., containing 40.00 acres. The
improvements consist of fencing, value t

$50.00.

No bid on the above described tracts will
be accepted for leas than THREE DOL- -

LARS ($3.00) per sere, which is the ap- -

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay for the itn-- 1

provements that exist on the land.

Each of the above described tracts will
be offered for sale separately.

The above sale of land will be subject
to the following terms and conditions, vis.:

Except for land selected for the Santa
Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund,
the successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner of Public Lands or his agent
holding auch sale, of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the bal-

ance of such purchase price, fees for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all coats
incidental to the sale herein, each and all
of aaid amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of sale
and which aaid amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it hat been mailed to him by the
State Land Office, aaid contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at hie option
make payments of not less thsn

of ninety-fiv- e per cent of the pur-
chase price at any time after the ssle and
prior to the expiration of thirty years from
the date of the contract and to provide
for the payment of any unpaid balance at
the expiration of thirty yeara from the
date of the contract with interest on defer-
red payments at the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract, par-
tial payments to be credited on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract next
following the date of tender.

The aale of land selected for the Snnt.i
Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond Fund
will be eubject to the above terms snd
conditions except that the successful bidder
must pay in cash or certified exchange at
the time of aale. h of the purchase
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the balance
of snch purchase price and will be re-

quired to execute a contract providing for
the payment of the balance of such pur-
chase price in thirty equal annual instal-
ments with interest on all deferred pay
ments at the rate of four per cent per
annum in advance, payments and interest
due on October first of each year.

The above sab of land will be subject
to valid exiating righta, casements, rights-of-way- ,

and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding snch tale reserves the right
to reject any aad all bids offered at said
tab.

Possession ander contract of aale for the
above described tracts will be given an
signing of the contract.

Witness hand end the official seal

N.. K. 9 E.. containinK 9.17.10 acres. The
improvements consist of fent'tig and

value $1074.00.

Sale No. 1290 - EXNWX. s-

T. 16 N., R. 9 E conta-inin- 2W" acr-s-

The improvements consist ol fencitic., value
$2W.0O.

Sal No. 121 - KXNEX. Sec. 32: NX
NW'4, Sec. 33: T. 16 N., R. 9 E., ci.iil.iining
16000 acres. The improvements consist of
well and fencing, value $530.00

No bid on the shove desrrib-- 1 tmets will
he accepted for less than THREE DOL-

LARS (3.00) per acre, which is the ap-

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay for the im-

provements that exist on the land.

Each of the above described tracts will
be ollered for sale separably.

The above sale ol land will be subject
to the lollowing terms and conditions, vn.:

Ttie Slireessful hidder mUSt Pay tO the
Commissioner of Public l ands or his au'-n-

holding such sale, 01 tne
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest tn advance ior tne oa
ance of such purchase price, fees for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all costs
incidental to the sale herein, each and all
of said amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange at the time of sale
and which said amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State ol
New Mexico, if the successful bidder docs
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it has been mailed to htm by the
Siate Land Olfice, said contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may at his option
make payments ol not less than

of ninety-fiv- per cent of the pur-
chase price at any time after the sale and
prior to the expiration of thirty years Irom
the date of the contract and to provide
ior the payment of any unpaid balance at
the expiration of thirty years from the
date ol the contract with interest on deter-
red payments at the rate of four per cent
per annum payable in advance on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract, par-
tial payments to be credited on the an-

niversary of the date of the contract next
following the date of tender.

The above sale of land will be subject
to valid existing rights, essements. rights-of-wa-

and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding such sale reserves the right
to reject ally and all bids oilered at said
sale.

Possession under contract of sale for the
above described tracts will be given on

signing of the contrac

Witness my hand nnd the official seal
of the Suite Land Otfice of the State of
New Mexico, this IO1J1 day of July. 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.

First Publication .Inly 19, 1918.

Last Publication September 27. 1'dB.

STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

LINCOLN COUNTY

llllne of the Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fe. New Mexico.

Notice hereby given that pursuant to
liie provisions of an Act of CnnKnas, ap-

proved June 2flth, 1910, the laws of the
Stnte of New Mexico and the rules and

of the State Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Lands will offer
at public sale to the highest bidder at

o clock A. M on ai.imiuy. wt.
1918, in the town ol Carnioio, County of
Lincoln Slate ol New Mriicn in t al
the court house therein, the following lcs- -

erilied tracts of land. vir.

Sal. No. UN - Sy,SK. Sec. I?:
Sec. 20; T. 1 S., R. 15 E., containing 2.W.40

seres. There are no improvements on this
tract.

Sal. No. im - StfSWia. Sec. ; T. 9

S., R. I E., containing SO acres. There are
no improvements on this tract.

WtfNWja:, Sec. 15: V

ecu e.-- n- - NKSWU. Sec. 27; NtfSEtf.
c 'yt. T e S R F... containing 32O.0O

acres. There are no improvements on this
trsct.

Sale No. MM - Lot 4. Sec. 19; Lott 1,

2. 1, EJ4SVVH, Sec, 30; T. 9 S., R. 9 E.,
conliining 237.H0 teres. The improvements
consist ol house, barn and wtlL valne

109.lia

Sal. Ne. UK - StfSVVX, SWHSE. Sec

6; T. 10 S., R. 14 E., containing 11R.70

acres. 1 nere are no improvement. "
tract.

Sale N. UM - SEHNE. NEKSES, S'
SEX. Sec. 13; T. 10 S., R. 14 E.. contain-
ing 160.00 acres. There are no improve-ment- s

on this tract.

No bid on the above described tracts will
be accepted for less thsn THREE DOL-

LARS 3.00) per acre, which is the ap-

praised value thereof, and in addition thereto
the successful bidder must pay for the

that exist on the land.

Each of the above described trsctt will
be offered for tale aeparately.

The above tate of land witl be subject
to the following terms and conditions, via.:

The successful bidder must pay to the
Commissioner ol Public Lands or his agent
holding such sale, of the
price offered by him for the land, four
per cent interest in advance for the bal-

ance of such purchase price, fees for ad-

vertising and appraisement and all costs
incidental to the aale herein, each and all
of aaid amounts must be deposited in cash
or certified exchange nt the tins of sale
and which aaid amounts and all of them
are subject to forfeiture to the State of
New Mexico, if the successful bidder does
not execute a contract within thirty days
after it hat been mailed to him by the
State Land Office, aaid contract to pro-
vide that the purchaser may tt hit option
make payments of not less than

of ninety-fiv- e per cent of the pur-
chase price at any time after the aale and
prior to the expiration of thirty years from
the dste of the contract and to provide
for the payment of any unpaid balance at
the expiration of thirty years from the
date of the contract with interest on defer-
red paymenta at the rate of four per cent
per annnm payable in ndvanct on the an-

niversary of the date nf the contract, par- -

the payment ot the balance ot sucn pur-
chase price in thirty equal annual instal-
ments with interest on all deferred pay-
ments at the rate of four per cent per
annum in advance, payments and interest
due on October first, of each year.

The above sale of land will be subject
to valid existing rights, easements, rights-of-wa-

and reservations.

The Commissioner of Public Lands or his
agent holding such sale reserves the right
to reject any and all bids offered at said
sale.

Possession under contract of sale for the
above described tracts will be given on
signing of the contract

Witness my hand and the official seal
of the State Land Office of the State of
New Mexico, this 10th day of July, 1918.

ROBT. P. ERVIEN,
Commissioner of Public Lands

State of New Mexico.

First Pablication July 19. 1918.
Last Publication September 27, 1918.

-- -
STATE OF NEW MEXICO

NOTICE FOR PUBLICATION

PUBLIC LAND SALE

LUNA COUNTY

Office of the Commissioner of Public
Lands,

Santa Fe, New Mexico.

Notice ia hereby given that pursuant to
the provisions of an Act of Congress, ap-

proved June 20th, 1910, the laws of the
State of New Mexico and the rules and
regulations of the Stste Land Office, the
Commissioner of Public Lands will offer
at public sale to the highest bidder at
9 o'clock A. M., on Saturday, October 19th,
1918, in the town of Deming, County of
Luna, State of New Mexico, in front of
the court house therein, the following des-

cribed tracts of land, via.:

Sale No. 1231 NEXNEX, Sec. 18; T.
21 S , R. 5 Wa containing 40.00 acret telect-e-

for the Santa Fe and Grant County
Railroad Bond Fund. The Improvements
consist of house, well, windmill, corrals,
tank and fencing, value $1,400.00.

Sale No. 1232 EXEX. Sec 31; All of
Sec. 32; T. 21 S., R. 10 W containing
800.00 acres. The improvements consist of
fencing, value $250.00.

Sale No. 1233 Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, Sec. 30;
T. 23 S.. R. 10 W., EXEX, Sec. 25; T. 23

S., R. 11 W., containing 319.04 acres select-
ed for the Santa Fe and Grant County
Railroad Bond Fund. There are no im-

provements on this tract

Sale No. 1234 NWX, Sec. 4; T. 25 S.,
R. 8 W., containing 163.78 acres. The im-

provements consist of house, corrals, well,
and grubbing, value $655.00.

Sala No. 123S - NWX. Sec. 33; T. 26 S..
R. 9 W., containing 160.00 acres selected
for the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-

road Bond Fund. The improvements con-
sist of well and clearing, value $125.00.

Sals No. I2M SEX. Sec. 21; T. 26 S.,
R. 9 W containing 160.00 acres selected for
the Santa Fe and Grant County Railroad
llond Fund. The improvements consist of
well, fencing and clearing, value $300.00.

Sale No. 1217 NEX. Sec. 22; T. 26 S.,
R. 10 W.. containing 160.00 acres selected
for the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-

road Bond Fund. The improvements con-
sist of house, well, fencing and clearing,
value f4W.nn.

Sale No. 1218 All of Section 2; T. 26

S., R. II W containing 593.26 acres. There
are no improvements on this trsct.

Sala No. 123 - NEXSWX. SWXSWX.
Sec. 8; WXSEX, Section 18; WXNEX,
Section 19; T. 20 S., R. 3 W.,
containing 240.00 acres, selected for the
Santa Fe and Grant County Railroad Bond
Fund. The improvements contitt of
fencing, value $175.00.

Sab Na. 1248 - EX, SWX, Sec 22; NX.
NEXSEX. SWXSEX, SEXSWX. Sec. 23;
SEXNWX. Sec. 25; EXNWX, NEXSWX,
Sec. 26; T. 20 S., R. 10 W containing
1080.00 acres. There are no improvements
on this tract

Sab Na. 1241 EXSEX. Sec. 24; SWX
SEX, SEXSWX, Sec 36; T. 23 S R. 5 W
containing 160.00 acres. There art so im-

provements on this tract
Sale No. 1242 SEX, SXNEX. EXSWX,

Sec 24; T. 23 S., t W., containing
320.00 acrea selected for the Ssnta Fe and
Grant County Railroad Bond Fund. The
improvements consist of barn, well, pump
house, fencing, corral, value $982.00.

Sab Na. 1241 - NWX, Sec 12; T. 23 S.,
R. 9 W- - containing 160.00 acres selected
for the Santa Fe and Grant County Rail-

road Bond Fund. The improvements con-
sist of fencing and 20 acres cleared, value
$335.00.

Sale No. 1244 SWX, Sec 15; T. 25 S.,
R. 10 W., containing 160.00 acres selected
for the Santa Fe arrd Grant County Rail-
road Bond Fund. The improvements con-
sist of fencing and clearing, value $250.00.

Sab No. I2 SWX. Sec 4: T. 26 S.. R.
10 W., containing 160.00 acres selected for
tne Santa re ana urant vouniy nauroaa
Bond Fund. There are no improvements
oa this tract

Sab Na. 1248 WX, Sec 27; All of Sec-
tions 31, 32, 33; WX. Sec 34; T. 21 S.. R.
13 W., All of Sections 1, 12, 13; NX. SEX,
Sec 24; EX, Sec 25; T. 21 S., R. 14 W
WX, Sec 3; All of Sections 4, 5. 6; WX,
Sec 7; All of Sec 8; WXNEX. WX. SEX.
Sec 9; EXNWX. SWX. Sec K; All of
Sec 16; Lots L 2, SEXNWX. EXSWX. Sec.
18; T. 22 S, R. 13 W SX, Sec 5; All
of Sections a, 17; T. 24 S., R. 13 W con-

taining 11674.52 acrea, of which 8608.13 acres
were selected for the Santa Fa and Grant
Coanty Railroad Bond Fund. There are
ao improvements oa this tract.

Sab Na. 127 All of Sec N; T ' 28

S., R. W containing 640.00 acrea. There
arc no improvements oa this tract

Sab Na. 1248 All of Sections 27, 34;
T. 26 &, R. 6 W, NEX, Sec 5; AH of
Sec TjWXv Sea, 8; All of Sectioaa 17,
18, 19; WX. Sec 20; All of Section 33,
34, 15; T. 27 S, R. 6 W, All of Sections
1L 13, 14, 23, 24, 25; NX; Sec 26;A .3 W M- - T 2? S R. t W sru.
Sec 6; SX. Sec I; SM. Sec 4; EX. Sec


