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« A large crowd attended Garden 
Club at the home of Doris Chap
man Tuesday afternoon. Mr. Rob
inson gave a very interesting and

Fisher River News Fermenter ValleyNOTICE OF THE CREATION AMD 
ESTABLISHMENT OF HORSE 

HERD DISTRICT NUMBER ONE 
OF LINCOLN COUNTY:

Notice is hereby given that Horse 
Herd District No. 1 was duly and 
regularly created and established 
by the Board of County Commis
sioners of Lincoln County by order 
made on April 19, 1948; that such 
Horse Herd District and the regu
lations thereof will be in full force 
and effect for all twelve months 
of each year from and after the 
20th day of May, 1948; That the 
boundaries of said Horse Herd Dis
trict as set forth in said order of 
County Commissioners is as fol
lows:

Beginning on the United States- 
Canadian boundary line at N. E. 
Cor. of Township No. 37 N., 
Rge 27 W.; thence running in a
S. E. direction along the W. 
boundary of Kootenai Nat. For
est to the S. E. cor. of Sec. 15,
T. 36 N.. Rge 26 W.; thence 
W. on S. boundary line of said • 
Sec. 15, extended, to Tobacco 
River; thence in a N. W. direc
tion along center line of said 
river to its junction with Koo
tenai River; thence along the E. 
bank of said Kootenai River in 
a N. direction to the U. S.- 
Canadian boundary line; thence 
E. along said boundary line to 
place of beginning.
Dated this 21st day of April, 1948. 
Board of County Commissioners 
of Lincoln County.
By G. C. EARLE

Clerk and Recorder.
(2t - April 29 - May 13)

LEGAL NOTICE* 1"

*OFFICIAL CALL FOR CONVEN
TION OF REPUBLICAN PRECINCT 
COMMITTEEMEN AND COM- 
MITTEEWOMEN O F LINCOLN 
COUNTY TO ELECT DELEGATES 
AND ALTERNATE DELEGATES 
TO STATE CONVENTION . IN 
HELENA ON MAY 18 TO ELECT 
DELEGATES AND ALTERNATE 
DELEGATES TO THE REPUBLI
CAN NATIONAL CONVENTION 
AND TO NOMINATE PRESIDEN

TIAL ELECTORS
Pursuant to the provisions of Sec

tions 173.3, 673.4 and 673.5 of the 
Revised Codes of Montana of 1935, 
I do hereby call a convention of 
the Republican precinct committee
men and committee women of Lin
coln County to meet in Court room 
in the City of Libby, Montana, at 
8 o’clock P. M., on May 11, being 
the second Tuesday in May, for the 
purpose of electing TWO delegates 
and TWO alternate delegates to a 
state convention of the Republican 
Party to be held in Helena at 10 
o’clock a. m., on May 18, being the 
third Tuesday in May, for the pur
pose of electing 11 delegates and 11 
alternate delegates to the Republi
can National Convention to be held 
on June 21, 1948, in the City of 
Philadelphia, Pennsylvania, and to 
nominate four presidential electors.

No person other than a duly 
elected or appointed Republican 
precinct committeeman 
mitteewoman of Lincoln County 
shall participate in the convention 
for which this call is hereby issued, 
but said committeeman or com- 
mitteewoman may be represented 
by proxy, provided that said proxy 
has been duly executed and is held 
by an elector of the precinct of 
which the committeeman or com- 
mitteewoman executing the proxy 
is a resident.

In the absence of a qualified com
mitteeman or committeewoman and 
his or her duly appointed proxy, 
the convention may fill the vacancy 
by appointing some qualified elector 
of the Republican Party, resident in 
the precinct, to represent such pre
cinct in the convention.

(Signed) HtH
Chairman of Lincoln County 
Republican .Central Committee

Date, April 26, 1948.

National Forest Timber For Sale James Shanholtzer made a busi- 
ness trip up the Yaak Saturday. He worthwhile talk on soil and con
found the roads in very bad shape. *rol of weeds and pests. The next

meeting will be at the J. Shan
holtzer ranch with Rose Robert
son, co-hostess.

Mr. and Mrs Ralph Alberts, sons 
Tommy and Freddy and niece 
Wilma Jean, and Mrs. Ethel Shelley 
and family were dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry E. Davis last 
Monday.

Donald Beebe. USN, San Diego, 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Beebe and family. With him were 
his mother. Mrs. R. R. Beebe, and 
his sister. Mrs. V. Kimber, and baby 
both of Libby.

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Beebe and 
family visited the Bill Keneltys 
Saturday.

Mr and Mrs. V Kimber and fam
ily of Libby were Friday evening 
visitors at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Hubert Beebe.

Wednesday. Mrs. Tangen, Mrs. 
Chas. Olson, Mrs. Donald Lloyd, 
Mrs. Hubert Beebe, Mrs. Ethel 
Shelley and Mrs, Wayne Wilson 
were guests of Mrs. Truman Troo
per.

Sealed bids will be received by 
the Forest Supervisor, Libby, Mon
tana, up to 4:00 p. m., May 31, 1948, 
for all live timber marked or desig
nated for cutting and all merchant
able dead timber standing or down 
located on an area embracing about 
62 acres within SWV«, Section 19 
and W'4, Section 29, T. 33 N„ R. 
28 W„ M. P. M.. Ural Creek, Koo
tenai National Forest, Montana, es
timated to be 440 M feet b. m. larch 
and 25 M feet b. m. Douglas fir, 
more or less. No bid of less than 
$4.25 per M feet for larch and Doug
las fir will be considered. In ad
dition to payments for stumpage, 
purchaser will be required to de
posit into special funds in the Treas
ury of the United States, $1.00 per 
M for total timber cut to cover 
stand improvement costs and $1.25 
per M for total timber cut to cover 
costs of slash disposal. $300 must 
be deposited with each bid to be 
applied on the purchase price, re
funded, or retained in part as liq
uidated damages, according to 
itions of sale.
than $300 will be required, 
right to reject any and all bids is 
reserved. Before bids are submit
ted, full information concerning the 
timber, the conditions of sale, and 
the submission of bids should be ob
tained from the Forest Ranger, 
Warland, Montana.

(2t - April 29 - May 27)

The Garden Club held a very 
satisfactory food sale Saturday.

Several in our community have 
signed for the Garden Club Beauti
fication contest. We hope to have 
all home owners entered soon.

Mrs. James Shanholtzer has been 
on the sick list this weekend.

The buildings on the Paul Evans 
ranch are going up fast.

Joyce Fuller has returned from 
a visit w’ith her sister, Marion, and 
family.

C. Ramsey was a business caller 
at Shanholtzer’s Saturday evening.

VFW MEMBERS REPORT 
FINE CONVENTION

Members of the Veterans of For
eign Wars, who attended the con
vention in Kalispell last weekend, 
report that it was a fine meet.

While they were there, Walter 
McCallum took his third degree in 
the Cooties, a subordinate of the 
VFW Posts.

The Ernest Davis family had a 
chimney fire Saturday morning.
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Mrs Kyle Beebe returned last 
Thursday from Spokane.

Mrs. Harry Waylett and son Don- 
ny returned home Sunday from a 

at Butte. Mrs. Waylett’s 
mother. Mrs. Corey, stayed on in 
Butte for a longer visit.

Saturday evening, a poker party 
was enjoyed at the Raven Ranger 
Station Those attending were 
Harry Waylett. Harry Davis, Jerry 
Buell, Ben Baenen, Thurman Tros- 
per, Harvey Shelley. Warren Robbe, 
and George Wolstad.

George Wolstad. former ranger 
here, and Mrs. Wolstad are visit
ing with the Thurman Trospers.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Lindgren of 
Spokane are visiting with their son- 
in-law and daughter. Mr. and Mrs. 
Harry E. Davis and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Lindgren and 
children of Poison were week-end 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Harry E. 
Davis.

The 4-H Club met at the Harry 
Davis home Friday night and 23 
attended, Mr. Robinson, the county 
agent, was there and went through 
the projects that the club is taking 
up. Mrs. Ethel Shelley is the girl’s 
leader and Hubert Beebe is the 
boy s leader. The next meeting, on 
May 14. will be held at the Harry 
Wayletts.
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National Forest Timber For Sale
National Forest Timber For Sale

Sealed bids will be received by 
the Forest Supervisor, Libby, Mon
tana, up to 4:00 p. m„ May 3, 1948 
for all live timber marked or desig
nated for cutting and all merchant
able dead timber standing or down 
located on an area embracing about 
114 acres within the Et£, Section 
28, T. 29 N„ R. 33 W., M. P. M. 
Payne Creek, Kootenai National 
Forest, Montana, estimated to be 
800 M feet b. m. ponderosa pine, 
170 M feet b. m. western larch and 
Douglas fir, more or less, 
of less than $7.00 per M feet for 
ponderosa pine and $4.00 per M feet 
for western larch and Douglas fir 
will be considered. In addition to 
payments for stumpage, purchaser 
will be required to deposit into 
special funds in the Treasury of 
me United States, $2.00 per M for 
total timber cut to cover stand im
provement costs, and $1.25 per M 
for total timber cut to cover costs 
of slash disposal. $500 must be de
posited witn eacn bid, to be applied 
on the purchase price, refunded, or 
retained in part as liquidated dam
ages, according to conditions of 
sale. A bond of not less than $750 
will be required. The right to re
ject any and all bids is reserved. 
Before bids are submitted, full in
formation concerning the timber, 
the conditions of sale, and the sub- 

of bids should be obtained

wWSealed bids will be received by 
the Forest Supervisor, Libby, Mon
tana, up to 4:00 p, m., May 31, 1948, 
for all live timber marked or desig
nated for cutting and all merchant
able dead timber standing or down 
located on an area embracing about 
350 acres within surveyed Section 
6 and SW'-i Section 5, T. 33 N„ R. 
25 W.. M. P. M., Lime Creek, Koo
tenai National Forest, Montana, es
timated to be 1,345 M feet b. 
larch and 507 M feet b. m. Douglas 
fir, more or less. No bid of less 
than $5.25 per M feet for larch and 
Douglas fir will be considered. In 
addition to payments for stumpage, 
purchaser will be required to de
posit into special funds in the Treas
ury of the United States, $.25 per M 
for total timber cut to cover stand 
improvement costs and $1.25 per M 
for total timber cut to cover costs of 
slash disposal. $450 must be de
posited with each bid, to be applied 
on the purchase price, refunded, or 
retained in part as liquidated dam
ages' according to conditions of sale. 
A bond of not less than $800 will be 
required. The right to reject any 
and all bids is reserved, 
bids are submitted, full information 
concerning the timber, the condi
tions of sale, and the submission of 
bids should be obtained from the 
Forest Ranger, Fortine, Montana.

(2t - April 29 - May 27)

..... DRIVE IN
OVAL-C Emblem of Excellence

:

G. C. EARLE

It No bid SHERIFF’S SALE WEED AND VERMIN...m.
The Federal Land Bank of Spokane, 
a corporation, Plaintiff.

Against
Everett E. Downing, Regina Down
ing; et al. Defendants.
TO BE SOLD AT SHERIFF’S SALE:

On the 24th day of May A. D., 
1948, at 2 o’clock P. M., at the front 
door of the Court House, in the 
City of Libby, County of Lincoln. 
State of Montana, to the highest 
and best bidder for cash in hand, 
the following described real estate 
lying and being in the County of 
Lincoln and State of Montana: 

Lots Nine (9), Ten (10), Eleven 
(11), Section Nine (9), Town
ship Thirty (30); North, Range 
Thirty (30), West of the Mon
tana Meridian,
Together with all and singular the 

tenements, hereditaments and ap
purtenances thereunto belonging or 
in anywise appertaining.

Dated this 28th day of April, A. 
D„ 1948.

THE GLACIER SILVER LEAD 
MINING COMPANY 
514 Columbia Bldg. 

Spokane, Wash. KILLERSNOTICE OF ASSESSMENT
To the Stockholders of The Glac

ier Silver Lead Mining Co.
Notice is hereby given that at 

the regular monthly meeting of the 
Board of Directors of The Glacier 
Silver Lead Mining Company held 

Monday, the 8th day of March, 
1948, at 2:00 o’clock p. m. at the 
office of the company, 514 Colum
bia Building in Spokane, Washing
ton, an assessment of five (5) mills, 

one-half (%) cent a share, was 
levied upon the outstanding capital 
stock of the corporation effective 
March 20, 1948, and payable on or 
before April 20, 1948 to F. W. Kies- 
ling, Treasurer of the company, at 
the office of the company, 514 Col
umbia Building, Spokane, Washing
ton.

2, 4-D WEED KILLER
* Moose & Rat Killer• Willgrow Death Dust

• Pestroy—25% DDT produet • Rl&spray

on
Chop Feed 

Ground Barley 

Groom) Oats 

Ground Wheat 

Straw—:—Salt 

Oyster Shell

Blue Tag Laying Mash 

Em-Em Co. Dual Purpose 

Dairy Feed 

Hog Feed 
Growing Mash 

Starting Mash

or
Before

mission
from the Forest Hanger, Troy, Mon
tana. Grits—:—Bone Meal

Phone 60W - Daily Deliveries of Feed & Grain
(2t - April 1-29)

Any stock upon which this assess
ment shall remain unpaid on April 
20, 1948 will be delinquent and ad
vertised for sale at public auction 
and unless payment is made before, 
will be sold on the 20th day of May, 
1948, at the Lincoln County Court
house at Libby, Montana at the 
hour of 2:00 o’clock p. m. mountain 
time to pay the delinquent assess
ment together with costs of adver
tising and expenses of sale.

The Glacier Silver Lead Mining 
Company
By F. W. KIESLING 
Secretary-Treasurer

March 18, 1948
NOTICE OF POSTPONEMENT
By order of the Board of Directors 

of the Glacier Silver Lead Mining 
Company the date of the above 
mentioned sale has been postponed 
from the 20th day of May, 1948 to 
the 19th day of June. 1948 at the 
same time and place as above men
tioned.

J, R. LIVENGOOD 
Sheriff of Lincoln County, 
Montana.

(4t - April 29 - May 6-13-20)
The Western News Classilu 

are business getters.NOTICE OF CLOSING OF 
REGISTRATION BOOKS FOR THE 
PRIMARY NOMINATING ELEC
TION, TO BE HELD JULY 20, 1948.

Notice is hereby given that the 
registration books for the several 
precincts in Lincoln County, Mon
tana, will be open at the County 
Clerk’s office on legal days between 
the hours of 9:00 o’clock A. M. and 
5:00 o’clock p. m., up to and includ
ing June 4, 1948, for the purpose of 
registering for the Primary Nomi
nating Election to be held July 20, 
1948.

REGISTRATION BOOKS FOR 
THE PRIMARY NOMINATING 
ELECTION CLOSE FRIDAY, 
JUNE 4. 1948.
Electors may register for the en

suing election by appearing before 
the County Clerk at his office, or 
by appearing before a deputy regis
trar, or before any Notary Public 

Justice of the Peace in the man
ner provided by law.

If you failed to vote at the last 
General Election or voted an ab
sent voter’s ballot, you must re
register. _

BE SURE THAT YOU ARE 
REGISTERED.

Robertson Feed StoreChristianHOW YOU WILL 
BENEFIT BY READING ■asassgsgAT

*

Hi* world'« dolly newspaper—

THE CHRISTIAN SCIENCE MONITOR. You will find yourself on« of 
the best-informed persons in your community on world offoin when 
you reod this world-wide doily newspoper regularly. You will gom 
fresh, new viewpoints, a fuller, richer understanding of today's vital 
news—PLUS help torn its exclusive features on homemaking, educa- 

, thedfer, music, rodio, sports.

Reserve District No. 9 

REPORT OF CONDITION OF

FIRST STATE BANK OF LIBBYtton, business

Subscribe new te 
this speclel "get- | 
acquainted’* efter

(OS. funds*!

k1 The Christian Science Publishing Society 
y One. Norway Street. Boston 15. Mass., U S A.
I Enclosed is $1, for which please send me The Christian

II Science Monitor lor one month.

T Nome___________ ______________________________ ____

PB-5
of Libby, Montana, at the close of business April 12th, 1948, a Stale 
banking institution organized and operating under the banking laws of 
this State and a member of the Federal Reserve System. Published in 
accordance with a call made by the State Banking Authorities and by 
the Federal Reserve Bank of this District.

ASSETS
Cash, balances with other banks, including reserve balance,

and cash items in process of collection .........................
United States Government obligations, direct and guaranteed 1,391,570.70
Obligations of States and political subdivisions ........... ......•- 53,255.17
Other bonds,' notes, and debentures ....................................... 6,075.00
Corporate stocks (including $2.250.00 stock of Federal Re

serve bank) ........................... ............................ .
Loans and discounts (including $ none overdrafts)
Bank premises owned $1,00. furniture and fixtures $1.00 

(Bank premises owned are subject to $ None liens not 
assumed by bank)

Real estate owned other than bank premises
Other assets .....................................................

TOTAL ASSETS

Street.

Zone Stot«.City. 556,647.48The Glacier Silver Lead Mining 
Company
By F. W. KIESLING 
Secretary-Treasurer 

(4t - April 29 - May 6-13-20)

or

2.250.00 
568,645 61

■ 2.0o

National Forest Timber tor Sale
G. C. EARLE,

County Clerk and Ex-Officio 
Registrar of Lincoln County, 
Montana.

(2t - April 29 - May 6)

> jt 1.00
10,369.32 

2,588.816 28Sealed bids will be received by 
the Forest Supervisor, Libby. Mon
tana, up to 4:00 p. m., May 3, 1948 
for all live timber marked or desig
nated for cutting and all merchant
able dead timber standing or down 
located on an area embracing about 
109 acres within’NEV* Section 22, 
SWV4NW»4 Section 23, T. 37 N., 
R. 28 W., M. P. M., on the Cole 
Road, Kootenai National Forest, 
Montana, estimated to be 16 M feet 
b. m. ponderosa pine, 156 M feet 
b. m. larch and 245 M feet b. m. 
Douglas fir, more or less. No bid 
of less than $6.00 per M feet for 
ponderosa pine and $2.00 per M feet 
for larch and Douglas fir will be 
considered. In addition to pay
ments for stumpage, purchaser will 
be required to deposit into special 
funds in the Treasury of the United 
States, $2.00 per M for total timber 
cut to cover stand improvement 
costs and $1.25 per M for total tim
ber cut to cover costs of slash dis
posal $200.00 must-be deposited 
with each bid, to be applied on the 
purchase price, refunded, or re
tained in part as liquidated dam
ages, according to conditions of sale. 
A bond of not less than $200.00 will 
be required. The right to reject 
any and all bids is reserved. Before 
bids are submitted, full information 
concerning the timber, the condi
tions of sale, and the submission 
of bids should be obtained from 
the Forest Ranger, Rexford, Mon
tana.

LIABILITIES
Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corpora-

tions • ................... ........ ............. . * .
Time deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 788,124.04 
Deposits of United States Government (including postal

savings) .......................................................................... ....
Deposits of States and political subdivisions ................. .......
Deposits of banks
Other deposits (certified and officers checks, etc.)

TOTAL DEPOSITS

I

NOTICE
Sealed bids for hauling grade and 

high school pupils on the following 
routes, will be received by the 
trustees of School District No. 1, 
Troy, Montana, not later than May 
10. 1948.

1. Route known as Lake Creek 
Route, to go from Troy school 
building on Highway No. 2, to Lake 
Creek road thence along Lake Creek 
road to the junction of Neils and 
Keeler Creek Roads and return. Bus 
to accommodate at least 25 pupils. 
Approximate mileage, 
round trip.

2. Route known as Iron Creek 
route, from school house at Troy 
to J. E. Pattie ranch and return. 
Bus to accommodate at least 3Q

’3. Route known as the Bull Lâke 
route. From the school house at 
Troy to Rhodes Ranch and return. 
Bus to accommodate at least 35 
pupils.

4. Route from Troy to Idaho line 
following the north side of the Koo
tenai river and return to the school 
house at Troy. Bus to accommodate 
at least 20 pupils.

The Board reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids.

Signed: '
MARTHA A. COBBLEDICK, 
Clerk.
(3t - April 22-29 - May 6)

• Come in and see thé New Improved.Titan Timber 
Saw, this chain saw Will definitely cui faster and is 
easier maintained than any other saw on the market. 
Full 10 Horse Power and at the new low price, begin
ning as low as $575.00 delivered in Kalispell, Mon
tana. We are prepared to make immediate delivery, 
on the saw of your choice, with terms if desired, at 
Bank term rates.

• We also carry a Complete Stock of Parts, for your 
convenience and will gladly serve you from 8:00 a. m. 
to 10:30 p. m. OUR SHOP is one of the most modern 
in tile state, equipped with up to the minute Factory
took and a Factory Trained Mechanic to 
maenine when service is required.

REMEMBER TITAN IS THE NAME for real CHAIN 
SAW SERVICE

3.315.74
245.738.50

None
10.093.36

$2,454.229.74
6,000.00

2,460,229.74

■Vj

Other Liabilities 
TOTAL LIABILITIES (not including subordinated 
obligations shown below) . ____

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS
25.000.00 
50,000.00 
53.586.54 

128,586.54 
2.588,816.28

$Capital* ..........................................-.... .—............................
Surplus ................................................ ..................................
Undivided profits .—.......................... —.........  ....................

Total Capital Accounts .................................................
Total Liabilities and Capital Accounts ........................

•This bank’s capital consists of;
Common stock with total par value of $25,000 00.

MEMORANDA
Assets pledged or assigned to secure liabilities and for

other purposes .............—;........  •-•--------------- j
Obligations subordinated to claims of depositors and otner

creditors, not included in liabilities .......-......... . ..„. ~_r.v
I J. Rolseth, Asst. Cashier, of the above-named Bank, hereby certify 

that the above statement is true to the best of my knowledge and belief 
J. ROLSETH

22 miles

service your 312,400 00pupils.
None

Correct—Attest;
Factory Authorized Distributor’s Far Northwestern Montana Area

623 W. IDAHO

J F. FENNESSY 
L. J. OLSON 
FRED F. CLARK 

Directors
State of Montana, County of Lincoln, ss:
Sworn to and subscribed before me thlsF^^) dj^yMAUkKK
Notary Public for the State of Montana, residing a?L»by, Aluaiaaa 

My commission expires June 7. 1949.

/*

PHONE 134L

THE Spot Gorage & Machinery Co.
Kalispell, Montana(2t - April 1-29)

mm


